
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2022 No. 214

The Sheriff Court Fees Amendment Order 2022

Amendment of the Sheriff Court Fees Order 2022

2.—(1)  The Sheriff Court Fees Order 2022(1) is amended as follows.
(2)  In each of schedules 1, 2 and 3, in the Tables of Fees, in Part 1 (sheriff court), at paragraph

16(a) (summary cause/simple procedure), in column 1, for “£200” substitute “£300”.
(3)  In schedule 1, in the Table of Fees, Part 1 (sheriff court), at paragraph 23(a) (defender’s

responses), in column 2, for “£134” substitute “£135”.
(4)  In schedule 2, in the Table of Fees, Part 1 (sheriff court)—

(a) at paragraph 3(a)(ii) (commissary proceedings), in column 2, for “£553” substitute “£554”,
(b) at paragraph 3(b)(ii) (commissary proceedings)—

(i) in column 2, for “£522” substitute “£554”,
(ii) in column 3, for “£512” substitute “£543”,

(c) at paragraph 23(a) (defender’s responses)—
(i) in column 2, for “£137” substitute “£138”,

(ii) in column 3, for “£134” substitute “£135”.
(5)  In schedule 3, in the Table of Fees, Part 1 (sheriff court)—

(a) at paragraph 3(a)(ii) (commissary proceedings), in column 3, for “£553” substitute “£554”,
(b) at paragraph 3(b)(ii) (commissary proceedings)—

(i) in column 2, for “£532” substitute “£565”,
(ii) in column 3, for “£522” substitute “£554”.

(1) S.S.I. 2022/181.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2022/181

