Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Town and Country
Planning (Fees for Applications) (Scotland) Regulations 2022, Section 15. (See end of Document for details)

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2022 No. 50

The Town and Country Planning (Fees for
Applications) (Scotland) Regulations 2022

PART 4

General provisions

Amendment of the Town and Country Planning (Hazardous Substances) (Scotland)
Regulations 2015 and saving provision

15.—(1) Subject to paragraph (3), the Town and Country Planning (Hazardous Substances)
(Scotland) Regulations 2015(1) (“the 2015 Regulations”) are amended in accordance with
paragraph (2).

(2) Inregulation 55(1) (fees for applications) of the 2015 Regulations—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£1,000” substitute “£1,200”, and
(b) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£500” substitute “£600”.
(3) The amendments made by this regulation apply only to applications made under regulations 6,

7 and 8 of the 2015 Regulations on or after 1 April 2022 and the 2015 Regulations continue to apply
in respect of any application made before 1 April 2022 as they did immediately before that date.

Commencement Information
n Reg. 15 in force at 1.4.2022, see reg. 1(1)

(1) S.S.I.2015/181 to which there are amendments not relevant to these Regulations.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2022/50/regulation/15
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2022/50/regulation/1/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2015/181

Changes to legislation:
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Town and Country Planning (Fees
for Applications) (Scotland) Regulations 2022, Section 15.




