
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2022 No. 52

The Council Tax Reduction (Scotland)
Amendment Regulations 2022

PART 2
Amendment of the Council Tax Reduction (Scotland) Regulations 2021

Uprating

25. In schedule 1 (applicable amount)—
(a) in the table in paragraph 1 (applicable amount for the purposes of regulation 35(a)), for—

(i) “£74.70” in each place where it occurs substitute “£77.00”,
(ii) “£59.20” substitute “£61.05”, and

(iii) “£117.40” substitute “£121.05”,
(b) in paragraph 2 (applicable amount for the purposes of regulation 35(b)), for “£85.75”

substitute “£88.50”,
(c) in the table in paragraph 17 (amounts of disability and carer premiums), in the entry—

(i) “Disabled child premium” for “£65.94” substitute “£68.04”,
(ii) “Carer premium” for “£37.70” substitute “£38.85”,

(iii) “Disability premium” for—
(aa) “£35.10” substitute “£36.20”, and
(bb) “£50.05” substitute “£51.60”,

(iv) “Severe disability premium” for—
(aa) “£67.30” in both places where it occurs substitute “£69.40”, and
(bb) “£134.60” substitute “£138.80”, and

(v) “Enhanced disability premium” for—
(aa) “£26.67” substitute “£27.44”,
(bb) “£17.20” substitute “£17.75”, and
(cc) “£24.60” substitute “£25.35”,

(d) in paragraph 23 (amount of work-related activity component), for “£29.70” substitute
“£30.60”, and

(e) in paragraph 24 (amount of support component), for “£39.40” substitute “£40.60”.


