Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2024 No. 35

The Council Tax Reduction (Scotland)
Amendment Regulations 2024

PART 3
Amendment of the Council Tax Reduction (Scotland) Regulations 2021

Uprating
14. In regulation 42(4) (calculation of income on a weekly basis (applicants with an award of
universal credit))(1)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£258.00” substitute “£275.00”, and
(b) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£442.00” substitute “£471.00”.

(1) Regulation 42 was relevantly amended by S.S.1. 2023/197.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2023/197

