
Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation and has not yet been made as a UK Statutory Instrument.

DRAFT STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1999 No.

The Social Security (Contributions) (Re-rating and
National Insurance Fund Payments) Order 1999

Rate of, and small earnings exception from, Class 2 contributions

2. In section 11 of the Act (Class 2 contributions)(1)–
(a) in subsection (1) (weekly rate) for “£6.35”, substitute “£6.55”;
(b) in subsection (4) (small earnings exception) for “£3,590”, substitute “£3,770”.

(1) Section 11 was further amended by article 2 of S.I.1998/469 from 6th April 1998.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1998/469

