Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation and has not yet been made as a UK Statutory Instrument.

DRAFT STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2005 No.

The Child Benefit and Guardian’s
Allowance Up-rating Order 2005

Amendment of the Child Benefit and Social Security (Fixing and Adjustment of Rates)
Regulations 1976

3. In regulation 2(1) of the Child Benefit and Social Security (Fixing and Adjustment of Rates)
Regulations 1976(1)

(a) in sub-paragraph (a)(i) for “£16.50” substitute “£17.00”’; and
(b) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£11.05” substitute “£11.40”.

(1) S.1. 1976/1267: the amounts in sub-paragraphs (a)(i) and (b) were last increased by article 3 of S.1.2004/942.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1976/1267
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2004/942

