Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as a UK Statutory
Instrument: The Automatic Enrolment (Earnings Trigger and Qualifying Earnings Band) Order 2015 No. 468

DRAFT STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2015 No.

The Automatic Enrolment (Earnings Trigger
and Qualifying Earnings Band) Order 2015

Increase of amounts
2. In section 13(1) of the Act (qualifying earnings)—
(a) in paragraph (a), for “£5,772” substitute “£5,824”; and
(b) in paragraph (b), for “£41,865” substitute “£42,385”.



