
Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as a UK Statutory
Instrument: The National Health Service (Licensing and Pricing) (Amendment) Regulations 2015 No. 2018

DRAFT STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2015 No.

The National Health Service (Licensing and
Pricing) (Amendment) Regulations 2015

Amendment of the National Health Service (Licensing and Pricing) Regulations 2013

2.—(1)  The National Health Service (Licensing and Pricing) Regulations 2013(1) are amended
as follows.

(2)  In regulation 5 (consultation on the proposed national tariff)—
(a) in paragraph (1), for “51 per cent” substitute “66 per cent”;
(b) in paragraph (2), for “51 per cent” substitute “66 per cent”; and
(c) omit paragraphs (3) to (8).

(3)  In regulation 6 (meaning of “relevant provider”)—
(a) in paragraph (1), for “sections 118(14)(b) and 120(2)(b) and 3(a)” substitute

“section 118(14)(b)”; and
(b) omit paragraphs (2) to (4).

(1) S.I. 2013/2214.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/2214

