Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation and has not yet been made as a UK
Statutory Instrument. This draft has been replaced by a new draft, The Automatic Enrolment
(Earnings Trigger and Qualifying Earnings Band) Order 2020 ISBN 978-0-11-119348-8

DRAFT STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2019 No.

The Automatic Enrolment (Earnings Trigger
and Qualifying Earnings Band) Order 2019

Increase of amounts

2. Insection 13(1) of the Act (which deals with qualifying earnings and the amounts constituting
the lower and upper thresholds of the qualifying earnings band)—

(a) in paragraph (a), for “£6,032” substitute “£6,136”;
(b) in paragraph (b), for “£46,350” substitute “£50,000”.



