
Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as
a UK Statutory Instrument: The Social Security Benefits Up-rating Order 2019 No. 480

DRAFT STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2019 No.

The Social Security Benefits Up-rating Order 2019

PART 6
EMPLOYMENT AND SUPPORT ALLOWANCE

Prescribed amount for the ESA Regulations 2013

28.—(1)  In regulation 62(2) of the ESA Regulations 2013(1) (prescribed amounts) for “£37.65”
substitute “£38.55”.

(2)  In regulation 62(2)(b) of the ESA Regulations 2013 (prescribed amounts), as it has effect in
cases falling within paragraphs 2 to 7 of Schedule 2 to the ESA and UC Regulations 2017(2), for
“£37.65” substitute “£38.55”.

(1) Relevant amending instrument is S.I. 2018/281.
(2) S.I. 2017/204. Regulation 62(2) of the ESA Regulations 2013 was substituted by regulation 3 of S.I. 2017/204 but that

amendment does not apply where any of the circumstances in paragraphs 2 to 7 of Schedule 2 to that S.I. apply. Relevant
amending instrument is S.I. 2018/281.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2018/281
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2017/204
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2017/204
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2018/281

