Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as a UK
Statutory Instrument: The Social Security Benefits Up-rating Order 2020 (revoked) No. 234

DRAFT STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2020 No.

The Social Security Benefits Up-rating Order 2020

PART 2
SOCIAL SECURITY BENEFITS AND PENSIONS

Increase in rates of Personal Independence Payment

16. In regulation 24 of the Social Security (Personal Independence Payment) Regulations
2013(1) (rate of personal independence payment)—

(a) in paragraph (1)(a) for “£58.70” substitute “£59.70”;
(b) in paragraph (1)(b) for “£87.65” substitute “£89.15”;
(c) in paragraph (2)(a) for “£23.20” substitute “£23.60”; and
(d) in paragraph (2)(b) for “£61.20” substitute “£62.25”.

(1) S.1.2013/377; relevant amending instrument is S.I. 2019/480.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/377
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2019/480

