
Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as a UK
Statutory Instrument: The Social Security Benefits Up-rating Order 2020 (revoked) No. 234

DRAFT STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2020 No.

The Social Security Benefits Up-rating Order 2020

PART 4
JOBSEEKER’S ALLOWANCE

Amounts for the JSA Regulations 2013

29. In regulation 49 of the JSA Regulations 2013(1) (weekly amounts of jobseeker’s allowance)
—

(a) in paragraph (1)(a) for “£57.90” substitute “£58.90”; and
(b) in paragraph (1)(b) for “£73.10” substitute “£74.35”.

(1) Relevant amending instrument is S.I. 2015/30.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2015/30

