Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as a UK Statutory
Instrument: The Energy Performance of Buildings (England and Wales) (Amendment) Regulations 2022 No. 413

DRAFT STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2022 No.

The Energy Performance of Buildings (England
and Wales) (Amendment) Regulations 2022

Amendment of the Energy Performance of Buildings (England and Wales) Regulations 2012

2.—(1) The Energy Performance of Buildings (England and Wales) Regulations 2012(1) are
amended as follows.

(2) Inregulation 28 (fees for entering data onto register)—
(a) in paragraph (a), for “£1.64” substitute “£1.50”; and
(b) in paragraph (b), for “£1.89” substitute “£1.70”.

(1) S.1.2012/3118, to which relevant amendments were made by S.I. 2013/603, S.1. 2014/880, S.I. 2015/609, S.1. 2016/284, S.1.
2017/368, S.1. 2018/362 and S.I. 2021/439.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2012/3118
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2013/603
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2014/880
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2015/609
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2016/284
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2017/368
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2017/368
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2018/362
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2021/439

