
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Housing (Financial Provisions)
(Scotland) Act 1972

1972 CHAPTER 46

PART V

CONTROLLED AND REGULATED TENANCIES

Miscellaneous

49 Amendment of Schedules 6 and 12 to Act of 1971

(1) Schedule 6 to the Act of 1971 (application for registration of rents unsupported by
certificate of fair rent) shall have effect as if—

(a) in paragraphs 1 and 2 for the words " seven days " there were substituted the
words " 14 days ";

(b) after paragraph 3 there were inserted the following paragraph—
“3A Where the rent officer, in carrying out his functions under this

Part of this Schedule, inspects a dwelling-house, he shall explain
to the tenant or to his spouse, if either is present at the inspection,
the procedure upon an application for the registration of a rent
under this Part of this Schedule.”

(2) Schedule 12 to the Act of 1971 (applications for registration of rents supported by
certificate of fair rent) shall have effect as if in paragraph 7 for the words " 7 days "
there were substituted the words " 14 days ".


