
Employment Protection (Consolidation) Act 1978 (c. 44)
SCHEDULE 12 – Death of Employee or Employer
Document Generated: 2024-07-13

1

Status: Point in time view as at 01/02/1991. This version of this provision has been superseded.
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Employment

Protection (Consolidation) Act 1978, Paragraph 27. (See end of Document for details)

S C H E D U L E S

SCHEDULE 12

DEATH OF EMPLOYEE OR EMPLOYER

Modifications etc. (not altering text)
C1 Sch. 12 extended (E.W.) (3.1.1995) by 1994 c. 40, ss. 20, 82(2), Sch. 8 para. 22

Sch. 12 extended (prosp.) by 1995 c. 26, ss. 46(4)(c), 180(1) (with s. 121(5))
Sch. 12 extended (E.W.) (26.8.1994) by 1994 c. 20, s. 4, Sch. 4 para. 22; S.I. 1994/1841, art. 2

PART IV

REDUNDANCY PAYMENTS: DEATH OF EMPLOYEE

27 (1) In relation to the making of a claim by a personal representative of a deceased
employee who dies before the end of the period of six months beginning with the
relevant date, subsection (1) of section 101 shall apply with the substitution for the
words “six months”, of the words “one year”.

(2) In relation to the making of a claim by a personal representative of a deceased
employee who dies after the end of the period of six months beginning with the
relevant date and before the end of the following period of six months, subsection (2)
of section 101 shall apply with the substitution for the words “six months”, of the
words “one year”.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1978/44/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1994/40
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1994/40/section/20
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1994/40/section/82/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1994/40/schedule/8/paragraph/22
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1978/44/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1995/26
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1995/26/section/46/4/c
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1995/26/section/180/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1995/26/section/121/5
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1978/44/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1994/20
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1994/20/section/4
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1994/20/schedule/4/paragraph/22
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1994/1841
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1994/1841/article/2


2 Employment Protection (Consolidation) Act 1978 (c. 44)
Document Generated: 2024-07-13

Status: 
Point in time view as at 01/02/1991. This version of this provision has been superseded.

Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Employment Protection (Consolidation)
Act 1978, Paragraph 27.


