
Status: Point in time view as at 01/02/1991.
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the
Countryside (Scotland) Act 1981, Section 6. (See end of Document for details)

Countryside (Scotland) Act 1981
1981 CHAPTER 44

6 Fines.

In sections 43, 44, 60, 60 and 75 of the Act of 1967 (which set out, inter alia, the
penalties for offences under these sections) the maximum fines to which a person shall
be liable on summary conviction shall be increased as follows—

(a) in section 43(4) (a) for “£50” there shall be substituted “£200”:
(b) in section 43(4) (b) for “£10” there shall be substituted “£50”;
(c) in section 43(4) (c) for “£50” there shall be substituted “£200”;
(d) in section 44(2) for “£50” there shall be substituted “£200”;
(e) in section 60(6) for “£20” there shall be substituted “£50”;
(f) in section 75(6) for “£20” there shall be substituted “£200”.

Modifications etc. (not altering text)
C1 The text of s. 6 is in the form in which it was originally enacted: it was not reproduced in Statutes in

Force and does not reflect any amendments or repeals which may have been made prior to 1.2.1991.



2 Countryside (Scotland) Act 1981 (c. 44)
Document Generated: 2024-05-12

Status: 
Point in time view as at 01/02/1991.

Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Countryside (Scotland) Act 1981,
Section 6.


