
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects
for the Finance Act 1983, Section 1. (See end of Document for details)

Finance Act 1983
1983 CHAPTER 28

PART I

CUSTOMS AND EXCISE

1 Duties on spirits, beer, wine, madewine and cider.

(1) In section 5 of the M1Alcoholic Liquor Duties Act 1979 (excise duty on spirits) for
“£14·47” there shall be substituted “ £15·19 ”.

(2) In section 36 of that Act (excise duty on beer) for “£20·40” and “£0·68” there shall
be substituted “ £21·60 ” and “ £0·72 ” respectively.

F1(3) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .
F2(4) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .

(5) In section 62(1) of that Act (excise duty on cider) for “£8·16” there shall be substituted
“ £9·69 ”.

(6) This section shall be deemed to have come into force on 16th March 1983.

Textual Amendments
F1 S. 1(3) repealed (21.7.2008) by Statute Law (Repeals) Act 2008 (c. 12), Sch. 1 Pt. 8
F2 S. 1(4) repealed by Finance Act 1984 (c. 43, SIF 40:1), s. 128(6), Sch. 23 Pt. I

Marginal Citations
M1 1979 c. 4.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2008/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2008/12/schedule/1/part/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1984/43
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1984/43/section/128/6
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1984/43/schedule/23/part/I
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1979/4


2 Finance Act 1983 (c. 28)
Document Generated: 2024-05-14

Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Finance Act 1983, Section 1.


