
Criminal Justice Act 1991 (c. 53)
SCHEDULE 12 – Transitional Provisions and Savings
Document Generated: 2024-06-30

1

Status: Point in time view as at 03/11/1994. This version of this provision has been superseded.
Changes to legislation: Criminal Justice Act 1991, Paragraph 20 is up to date with all changes known to be in

force on or before 30 June 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that
have been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

S C H E D U L E S

SCHEDULE 12

TRANSITIONAL PROVISIONS AND SAVINGS

Commencement Information
I1 Sch. 12 partly in force at 14.10.1991 see s. 102(2)(3) and S.I. 1991/2208, art. 2(1) and Sch. 1; further in

force at 25.10.1991 see s. 102(2)(3) and S.I. 1991/2208, art. 2(1) and Sch. 2; further in force at 1.10.1992
see s. 102(2)(3) and S.I. 1992/333, art. 2(2), Sch. 2; further in force on the day appointed by the Secretary
of State by order under s. 62(1) see S.I. 1992/333, art. 2(5), Sch. 3; Sch. 12 para. 16(2)-(4) in force
(1.6.1999) by S.I. 1999/1280, art. 3, Sch.

Supervision orders

20 (1) In relation to pre-existing failures to comply with the requirements of supervision
orders, section 15 of the 1969 Act as substituted by Schedule 7 to this Act shall apply
as if—

(a) in subsection (3)(a), for “£1,000” there were substituted “£100”;
(b) in subsection (5)(b), for “£5,000” there were substituted “£2,000”; and
(c) in subsection (5)(c), for “£5,000” there were substituted the words “£2,000

in the case of a person who has attained the age of 18 years and £400 in the
case of a person who has not attained that age”.

(2) In this paragraph “pre-existing” means occurring before the commencement of
section 66 of this Act and that Schedule.

Commencement Information
I1 Sch. 12 para. 20 wholly in force at 1.10.1992 see s. 102(2)(3) and S.I. 1992/333, art. 2(2), Sch. 2.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1991/53/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1991/53/section/102/2/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1991/2208
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1991/2208/article/2/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1991/2208/section/102/2/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1991/2208
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1991/2208/article/2/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1991/2208/section/102/2/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1992/333
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1992/333/article/2/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1992/333/schedule/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1992/333/section/I
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1991/53/schedule/12/paragraph/16/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1999/1280
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1999/1280/article/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1999/1280/schedule
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1991/53/schedule/12/paragraph/20
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1991/53/section/102/2/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1992/333
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1992/333/article/2/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1992/333/schedule/2


2 Criminal Justice Act 1991 (c. 53)
Document Generated: 2024-06-30

Status: 
Point in time view as at 03/11/1994. This version of this provision has been superseded.

Changes to legislation: 
Criminal Justice Act 1991, Paragraph 20 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or
before 30 June 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes
that have been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations.


