Status: Point in time view as at 01/07/2012.
Changes to legislation: Finance Act 2003, Part 1 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or
before 29 August 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have
been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

Finance Act 2003

2003 CHAPTER 14

PART 1

EXCISE DUTIES
Tobacco products duty

1 Rates of tobacco products duty

(1) For the Table of rates of duty in Schedule 1 to the Tobacco Products Duty Act 1979
(c. 7) substitute—

“TABLE
1. Cigarettes An amount equal to 22 per cent of the retail
price plus £96.88 per thousand cigarettes.
2. Cigars £141.10 per kilogram.
3. Hand-rolling tobacco £101.42 per kilogram.
4. Other smoking tobacco and chewing £62.03 per kilogram.”
tobacco

(2) This section shall be deemed to have come into force at 6 o'clock in the evening of
9th April 2003.

Alcoholic liqguor duties

2 Rate of duty on beer

(1) In section 36(1AA)(a) of the Alcoholic Liquor Duties Act 1979 (c. 4) (rate of duty on
beer), for “£11.89” substitute “ £12.22 .



2 Finance Act 2003 (c. 14)
Part 1 — Wine and made-wine of a strength not exceeding 22 per cent
Document Generated: 2024-08-29

Status: Point in time view as at 01/07/2012.
Changes to legislation: Finance Act 2003, Part 1 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or
before 29 August 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have
been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(2) This section shall be deemed to have come into force at midnight on 13th April 2003.

3 Rates of duty on wine and made-wine

(1) For Part 1 of the Table of rates of duty in Schedule 1 to the Alcoholic Liquor Duties
Act 1979 (rates of duty on wine and made-wine) substitute—

“PART 1

WINE AND MADE-WINE OF A STRENGTH NOT EXCEEDING 22 PER CENT

Description of wine or made-wine Rates of duty per hectolitre
£
Wine or made-wine of a strength not 4891

exceeding 4 per cent

Wine or made-wine of a strength exceeding 4 67.25
per cent but not exceeding 5.5 per cent

Wine or made-wine of a strength exceeding 158.69
5.5 per cent but not exceeding 15 per cent and
not sparkling

Sparkling wine or sparkling made-wine ofa  166.70
strength exceeding 5.5 per cent but less than
8.5 per cent

Sparkling wine or sparkling made-wine of 220.54
a strength of 8.5 per cent or of a strength

exceeding 8.5 per cent but not exceeding 15

per cent

Wine or made-wine of a strength exceeding  211.58”
15 per cent but not exceeding 22 per cent

(2) This section shall be deemed to have come into force at midnight on 13th April 2003.
Hydrocarbon oil duties

4 Rates of hydrocarbon oil duties

n section ot the Hydrocarbon O1l Duties Act C. rates ot duty)—
I ion 6(1A) of the Hyd: bon Oil Duties Act 1979 (c. 5 fd
(a) in paragraph (a) (ultra low sulphur petrol) for “£0.4582” substitute “ £0.4710

(b) in paragraph (b) (other light oil) for “£0.5468” substitute ““ £0.5620 ”,

(c) in paragraph (c) (ultra low sulphur diesel) for “£0.4582” substitute “ £0.4710
” and

(d) in paragraph (d) (other heavy oil) for “£0.5182” substitute “ £0.5327 ™.
(2) In section 6AA(3) of that Act (biodiesel duty) for “£0.2582” substitute “ £0.2710 .



Finance Act 2003 (c. 14) 3
Part 1 — Wine and made-wine of a strength not exceeding 22 per cent
Document Generated: 2024-08-29

Status: Point in time view as at 01/07/2012.
Changes to legislation: Finance Act 2003, Part 1 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or
before 29 August 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have
been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(3) In section 13A(1) of that Act (rebate on unleaded petrol) for “£0.0586” substitute *
£0.0601 .

(4) This section shall come into force on 1st October 2003.

5 Rebates on hydrocarbon oil duties

(1) In section 11(1) of the Hydrocarbon Oil Duties Act 1979 (rebate on heavy oil)}—
(a) in paragraph (a) (fuel oil) for “£0.0274” substitute ““ £0.0382 ”,
(b) in paragraph (b) (gas oil: general) for “£0.0313” substitute “ £0.0422 ”, and
(¢c) inparagraph (ba) (ultra low sulphur diesel) for “£0.0313” substitute “ £0.0422

(2) In section 14(1) of that Act (furnace fuel) for “£0.0274” substitute “ £0.0382 .

(3) This section shall be deemed to have come into force at 6 o'clock in the evening of
9th April 2003.

Betting and gaming duties

6 General betting duty and pool betting duty: relief for losses

(1) Part 1 of the Betting and Gaming Duties Act 1981 (c. 63) (betting duties) is amended
as follows.

(2) In section 5 (net stake receipts) at the end of subsection (3) (negative net stake receipts
to be disregarded) insert ““ except as provided for by section SAA .

(3) After that section insert—

“5AA Relief for losses

(1) This section applies where the amount of a person’s net stake receipts for an
accounting period in respect of a class of bets (calculated in accordance with
section 5(1)) is a negative amount.

(2) That amount shall be carried forward to the following accounting period and,
to the extent that it does not exceed it, deducted from the amount of the
person’s net stake receipts in respect of the same class of bets for that period.

(3) If the amount of those net stake receipts for that following accounting
period—
(a) 1is not a positive amount, or
(b) is less than the amount carried forward,
the amount carried forward or, as the case may be, the balance of it shall be

treated for the purposes of this section as if it were a negative amount of net
stake receipts for that period in respect of the same class of bets.”.

(4) Omit section 5A (multiple bets) (which becomes unnecessary as a result of the
amendment made by subsection (3) above).

(5) After section 7 (duty charged on net pool betting receipts) insert—



Finance Act 2003 (c. 14)
Part 1 — Wine and made-wine of a strength not exceeding 22 per cent
Document Generated: 2024-08-29

Status: Point in time view as at 01/07/2012.
Changes to legislation: Finance Act 2003, Part 1 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or
before 29 August 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have
been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

“TZA Relief for losses

(1) This section applies where the amount of a person’s net pool betting receipts
for an accounting period is a negative amount.

(2) That amount shall be carried forward to the following accounting period and,
to the extent that it does not exceed it, deducted from the amount of the
person’s net pool betting receipts for that period.

(3) If the amount of the net pool betting receipts for that following accounting
period—
(a) isnot a positive amount, or
(b) is less than the amount carried forward,
the amount carried forward or, as the case may be, the balance of it shall be

treated for the purposes of this section as if it were a negative amount of net
pool betting receipts for that period.”.

(6) The amendments made by this section apply in relation to any accounting period
beginning on or after 1st September 2003 for which the net stake receipts in respect
of a particular class of bets, or (as the case may be) the net pool betting receipts, is
a negative amount.

General betting duty: betting exchanges

(1) Part 1 of the Betting and Gaming Duties Act 1981 (c. 63) (betting duties) is amended
as follows.

(2) After section SAA (inserted by section 6 above) insert—

“SAB Betting exchanges

(1) This section applies where—
(a) one person makes a bet with another person using facilities provided
by a third person in the course of a business, and
(b) that business is one that does not involve the provision of premises
for use by persons making or taking bets.

(2) General betting duty shall be charged on the amounts (“commission charges™)
that the parties to the bet are charged, whether by deduction from winnings
or otherwise, for using those facilities.

(3) No deductions shall be allowed from commission charges.

(4) The amount of duty charged under this section in respect of bets determined in
an accounting period shall be 15 per cent of the commission charges relating
to those bets.

(5) For the purposes of this section, and section 5B(4) so far as relating to this
section, a person who arranges for facilities relating to a bet to be provided
by another person shall be treated as providing them himself (and the other
person shall not).”.

(3) In section 5B (liability to pay)—



Finance Act 2003 (c. 14) 5
Part 1 — Wine and made-wine of a strength not exceeding 22 per cent
Document Generated: 2024-08-29

Status: Point in time view as at 01/07/2012.
Changes to legislation: Finance Act 2003, Part 1 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or
before 29 August 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have
been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(a) for subsection (1) substitute—

“(1) All general betting duty chargeable in respect of—
(a) Dbets made in an accounting period, or
(b) in the case of duty chargeable under section 5AB, bets
determined in an accounting period,
shall become due at the end of that period.”;
(b) in subsection (4), after “section 4(1) to (3)” insert “ or SAB .

(4) In section 5C (bet-brokers)—

(a) in paragraph (a) of subsection (1) (application of section) after “in the course
of a business” insert “, other than a betting-exchange business, ”’;

(b) at the end of that subsection insert— “ In paragraph (a) “betting-exchange
business” means a business such as is mentioned in section SAB(1). ”;

(c) omit subsections (2) (bet treated as made between bettor and bet-broker)
and (3) (subsection (2) not to apply to off-course bets where bet-taker is a
bookmaker);

(d) in subsection (4) omit the words “In the case of a bet which is excluded from
subsection (2) by virtue of subsection (3),”.

(5) The amendments made by this section apply in relation to any accounting period
beginning on or after 1st June 2003.

(6) Those amendments do not apply in relation to a bet (a “straddling bet”) that is—
(a) made, using facilities provided by a person (“the broker”), in an accounting
period of the broker beginning before 1st June 2003, but

(b) not determined until an accounting period of the broker beginning on or after
that date.

(7) Any winnings paid in respect of a straddling bet to which section SAB of the Betting
and Gaming Duties Act 1981 (c. 63) would apply but for subsection (6) above shall be
treated for the purposes of that Act as paid in the broker’s accounting period in which
the bet was made (“the earlier accounting period”).

(8) Subsection (7) shall not have effect to reduce the general betting duty payable by the
broker for the earlier accounting period; but the amount of the reduction that would
(but for this subsection) have been made for that period shall be set against any liability
of the broker to general betting duty for accounting periods in the following three
years, taking earlier periods before later ones until the amount is exhausted.

8 General betting duty: restriction of exemption for on-course bets

(1) In section 12(4) of the Betting and Gaming Duties Act 1981 (general betting duty:
supplementary provisions), in the definition of “on-course bet” for “a meeting”
substitute ““ a horse or dog race meeting .

(2) This section applies to bets made on or after 1st September 2003.

9 Bingo duty

(1) For sections 17 to 20 of the Betting and Gaming Duties Act 1981 (bingo duty)
substitute—



Finance Act 2003 (c. 14)
Part 1 — Wine and made-wine of a strength not exceeding 22 per cent
Document Generated: 2024-08-29

Status: Point in time view as at 01/07/2012.
Changes to legislation: Finance Act 2003, Part 1 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or
before 29 August 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have
been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

“17 Bingo duty

(1) A duty of excise, to be known as bingo duty, shall be charged—
(a) on the playing of bingo in the United Kingdom, and
(b) at the rate of 15 per cent of a person’s bingo promotion profits for an
accounting period.

(2) Subsection (1) is subject to the exemptions specified in Part 1 of Schedule 3
to this Act.

(3) The amount of a person’s bingo promotion profits for an accounting period
is—
(a) the amount of the person’s bingo receipts for the period (calculated
in accordance with section 19), minus

b the amount of his expenditure on bingo winnings for the period
(calculated in accordance with section 20)

(4) Bingo duty charged in respect of a person’s bingo promotion profits shall be
paid by him.

(5) Where the amount that would be charged in respect of a person’s bingo
promotion profits for an accounting period is less than £1, no duty shall be
charged.

18 Accounting period

(1) For the purposes of section 17 an accounting period ends, and another begins,
at the end of the last Sunday in each calendar month.

(2) But regulations under paragraph 9 of Schedule 3 to this Act may make
provision in place of subsection (1) for the purposes of the application of
section 17 to specified persons or in specified circumstances.

(3) Regulations made by virtue of subsection (2) may make transitional provision.

19 Bingo receipts

(1) A person has bingo receipts for an accounting period if payments fall due in
the period in respect of entitlement to participate in bingo promoted by him.

(2) The amount of the person’s bingo receipts for the accounting period is the
aggregate of those payments.

(3) For the purposes of subsections (1) and (2)—

(a) an amount in respect of entitlement to participate in a game of bingo
is to be treated as falling due in the accounting period in which the
game is played,

(b) where a payment relates to a supply of services on which value added
tax is chargeable, the amount of value added tax chargeable shall be
disregarded (irrespective of whether or not that amount is paid by way
of value added tax),

(c) itisimmaterial whether an amount falls due to be paid to the promoter
or to another person,



Finance Act 2003 (c. 14) 7
Part 1 — Wine and made-wine of a strength not exceeding 22 per cent
Document Generated: 2024-08-29

Status: Point in time view as at 01/07/2012.
Changes to legislation: Finance Act 2003, Part 1 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or
before 29 August 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have
been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(d) it is immaterial whether an amount is described as a fee for
participation, as a stake, or partly as one and partly as the other, and

(e) where a sum is paid partly in respect of entitlement to participate in a
game of bingo and partly in respect of another matter—

(1) such part of the sum as is applied to, or properly attributable
to, entitlement to participate in the game shall be treated as
an amount falling due in respect of entitlement to participate
in the game, and

(i1) the remainder shall be disregarded.

20 Expenditure on bingo winnings

(1) A person’s expenditure on bingo winnings for an accounting period is the
aggregate of the values of prizes provided by him in that period by way of
winnings at bingo promoted by him.

(2) Where a prize is obtained by the promoter from a person not connected with
him, the cost to the promoter shall be treated as the value of the prize for the
purpose of subsection (1).

(3) Where a prize is a voucher which—

(a) may be used in place of money as whole or partial payment for
benefits of a specified kind obtained from a specified person,

(b) specifies an amount as the sum or maximum sum in place of which
the voucher may be used, and

(c) does not fall within subsection (2),

the specified amount is the value of the voucher for the purpose of
subsection (1).

(4) Where a prize is a voucher (whether or not it falls within subsection (2)) it
shall be treated as having no value for the purpose of subsection (1) if—

(a) it does not satisfy subsection (3)(a) and (b), or

(b) its use as described in subsection (3)(a) is subject to a specified
restriction, condition or limitation which may make the value of the
voucher to the recipient significantly less than the amount mentioned
in subsection (3)(b).

(5) In the case of a prize which—
(a) is neither money nor a voucher, and
(b) does not fall within subsection (2),
the value of the prize for the purpose of subsection (1) is—
(i) the amount which the prize would cost the promoter if obtained from
a person not connected with him, or
(i1) where no amount can reasonably be determined in accordance with
sub-paragraph (i), nil.

(6) For the purpose of this section—

(a) areference to connection between two persons shall be construed in
accordance with section 839 of the Income and Corporation Taxes
Act 1988 (connected persons), and



Finance Act 2003 (c. 14)
Part 1 — Wine and made-wine of a strength not exceeding 22 per cent
Document Generated: 2024-08-29

Status: Point in time view as at 01/07/2012.
Changes to legislation: Finance Act 2003, Part 1 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or
before 29 August 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have
been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(b) anamount paid by way of value added tax on the acquisition of a thing
shall be treated as part of its cost (irrespective of whether or not the
amount is taken into account for the purpose of a credit or refund).

20A Combined bingo

(1) A game of bingo is “combined bingo” if—
(a) it is multiple bingo within the meaning of section 1 of the Gaming
(Bingo) Act 1985, or
(b) itis played in more than one place and promoted by more than one
person.

(2) Payments made in respect of entitlement to participate in combined bingo
shall be treated for the purposes of section 19(1) as bingo receipts only of the
first promoter to whom (or at whose direction) they are paid.

(3) Where money representing stakes hazarded at combined bingo is paid in an
accounting period by one promoter of the bingo (“the first promoter”) to
another (“the second promoter”)—

(a) the money shall not be treated as a bingo receipt of the second
promoter for the purposes of section 19(1),

(b) the payment shall be treated as expenditure of the first promoter
on bingo winnings for the accounting period for the purposes of
section 20(1), and

(¢) no subsequent payment of all or part of the money shall be treated
as expenditure on bingo winnings for the purposes of section 20(1)
(whether paid by the second promoter to another person, by the first
promoter having received it from the second promoter, or otherwise).

(4) Subsections (2) and (3) shall apply only where the combined bingo is played
entirely in the United Kingdom.

20B Carrying losses forward

(1) Where the calculation of a person’s bingo promotion profits for an accounting
period results in a negative amount (“the loss”)—

(a) no bingo duty shall be chargeable in respect of that accounting period,
and

(b) for the purpose of section 17(3), the amount of the person’s
expenditure on bingo winnings for the next accounting period shall
be increased by the amount of the loss.

(2) Subsection (1) applies to an accounting period whether or not the loss results
wholly or partly from the previous application of that subsection.

20C Supplementary
(1) Part 2 of Schedule 3 to this Act (bingo duty: supplementary) shall have effect.

(2) In sections 17 to 20B above, this section and Schedule 3—

“bingo” includes any version of that game, whatever name it is
called,



Finance Act 2003 (c. 14) 9
Part 1 — Wine and made-wine of a strength not exceeding 22 per cent
Document Generated: 2024-08-29

Status: Point in time view as at 01/07/2012.
Changes to legislation: Finance Act 2003, Part 1 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or
before 29 August 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have
been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

“licensed bingo” means bingo played at premises licensed under—
(a) the Gaming Act 1968, or

(b) Chapter II of Part III of the Betting, Gaming, Lotteries and
Amusements (Northern Ireland) Order 1985,

“prize” means anything won at bingo, and

“United Kingdom” includes the territorial sea of the United
Kingdom.

(3) For the purposes of those provisions, except in relation to combined bingo,
the promoter of a game of bingo is—

(a) in the case of licensed bingo, the holder of the licence, and

(b) in the case of non-licensed bingo, the person who provides the
facilities for the game.

(4) For the purposes of those provisions in relation to combined bingo a person
promotes a game of bingo if he is wholly or partly responsible for organising
it or for providing facilities for it.

(5) In those provisions a reference to entitlement to participate in a game of bingo
includes a reference to an opportunity to participate in a game of bingo in
respect of which a charge is made (whether by way of a fee for participation,
a stake, or both).

(6) In proceedings relating to bingo duty under the customs and excise Acts an
averment in any process that a particular game is a version of bingo shall, until
the contrary is proved, be sufficient evidence that it is.”.

(2) In paragraph 1 of Schedule 3 to the Betting and Gaming Duties Act 1981 (c. 63) (bingo
duty: exemptions: domestic bingo) for “Bingo duty shall not be charged in respect of”
substitute ““ In calculating liability to bingo duty no account shall be taken of ™.

(3) For paragraph 2 of Schedule 3 to the Betting and Gaming Duties Act 1981 (bingo
duty: exemptions: small-scale bingo) substitute—

“Small-scale bingo

2 (1) This paragraph applies where entitlement to participate in non-licensed
bingo depends on a person’s being—

(a) amember of a group or organisation,
(b) aguest of a member of a group or organisation, or
(c) aguestof a group or organisation.

(2) Payments in respect of entitlement to participate in the non-licensed bingo
shall not be brought into account in relation to any person for the purpose
of section 19.

(3) Winnings at the non-licensed bingo shall not be brought into account in
relation to any person for the purpose of section 20.

Small-scale bingo

2A (1) In the case of non-licensed bingo to which paragraph 2 does not apply—

(a) payments in respect of entitlement to participate in the non-
licensed bingo shall not be brought into account in relation to any



10 Finance Act 2003 (c. 14)
Part 1 — Wine and made-wine of a strength not exceeding 22 per cent
Document Generated: 2024-08-29

Status: Point in time view as at 01/07/2012.
Changes to legislation: Finance Act 2003, Part 1 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or
before 29 August 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have
been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

person for the purpose of section 19 (subject to sub-paragraphs
(2) to (5) below), and

(b) winnings at the non-licensed bingo shall not be brought into
account in relation to any person for the purpose of section 20
(subject to sub-paragraphs (2) to (5) below).

(2) If on a day winnings at non-licensed bingo promoted by a person exceed
£500, sub-paragraph (1) shall not apply in relation to the person in
respect of the accounting period in which that day falls and the next two
accounting periods.

(3) If stakes exceeding in aggregate £500 are hazarded on a day at non-
licensed bingo promoted by a person, sub-paragraph (1) shall not apply
in relation to the person in respect of the accounting period in which that
day falls and the next two accounting periods.

(4) If in an accounting period winnings at non-licensed bingo promoted by a
person exceed £7,500, sub-paragraph (1) shall not apply in relation to the
person in respect of that accounting period and the next two accounting
periods.

(5) If stakes exceeding in aggregate £7,500 are hazarded in an accounting
period at non-licensed bingo promoted by a person, sub-paragraph (1)
shall not apply in relation to the person in respect of that accounting period
and the next two accounting periods.

(6) For the purposes of this paragraph winnings at bingo shall be valued in
accordance with section 20(2) to (6).”.

(5) In paragraph 5(1) of Schedule 3 to the Betting and Gaming Duties Act 1981 (c. 63)
(bingo duty: exemptions: commercial amusements) for “Bingo duty shall not be
charged in respect of” substitute “ In calculating liability to bingo duty no account
shall be taken of ™.

(6) In paragraph 6 of Schedule 3 to that Act (bingo duty: exemptions: machine bingo) for
“Bingo duty shall not be charged in respect of”” substitute *“ In calculating liability to
bingo duty no account shall be taken of ”.

(7) In paragraph 10(1) of Schedule 3 to that Act (notification and registration of bingo-
promoters) for “which will, or may, be chargeable with bingo duty” substitute “ in
connection with which bingo duty may be chargeable ™.

(8) The following paragraphs of Schedule 3 to that Act shall cease to have effect—
(a) paragraph 11 (announcement of prizes),
(b) paragraph 12 (records), and
(c) paragraph 15 (disputes).

(9) In paragraph 16(2) of Schedule 3 to that Act (enforcement)—
(a) for “(being bingo which is or may be chargeable with bingo duty)” substitute
“ (being bingo in connection with which bingo duty may be chargeable) ”, and
(b) paragraph (b) (and the word “or” immediately before it) shall cease to have
effect.



Finance Act 2003 (c. 14) 11
Part 1 — Wine and made-wine of a strength not exceeding 22 per cent
Document Generated: 2024-08-29

Status: Point in time view as at 01/07/2012.
Changes to legislation: Finance Act 2003, Part 1 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or
before 29 August 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have
been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(10) This section shall have effect in relation to bingo played on or after 27th October
2003 (with which day the first accounting period for the purposes of section 17 of the
Betting and Gaming Duties Act 1981 shall begin).

Textual Amendments
F1  S.9(4) repealed (19.7.2007) by Finance Act 2007 (c. 11), Sch. 27 Pt. 6(3)

10 Amusement machines not operated by coins or tokens

(1) In section 21 of the Betting and Gaming Duties Act 1981 (amusement machine
licences), for subsections (3B) to (3D) (meaning of “fifty-penny machine”)
substitute—

“(3B) For the purposes of this section an amusement machine is a “fifty-penny
machine” if, and only if—
(a) where it is a machine on which a game can be played solo, the cost
for each time the game is played on it solo—
(i) does not exceed 50p, or
(i1) where the machine provides differing numbers of games in
different circumstances, cannot exceed 50p;
and

(b) where it is a machine on which a game can be played by more than
one person at a time, the cost per player for each time the game is
played on it simultaneously by more than one player—

(i) does not exceed 50p, or

(i1) where the machine provides differing numbers of games in
different circumstances, cannot exceed 50p.”.

(2) In section 25(1) of that Act (definition of “amusement machine”), in paragraph (c) for
“coin or token” substitute “ coin, token or other thing .

(3) In section 26(2) of that Act (interpretation), for the definitions of “two-penny
machine”, “five-penny machine” and “ten-penny machine” substitute—

13333

two-penny machine” means an amusement machine in relation to which
the cost for each time a game is played on it—

(a) does not exceed 2p, or

(b) where the machine provides differing numbers of games in
different circumstances, cannot exceed 2p,

and “five-penny machine” and “ten-penny machine” have a corresponding
meaning;”.

(4) In the following provisions of the Value Added Tax Act 1994 (c. 23)—
(a) the definition of “gaming machine” in section 23(4), and
(b) Note (3) (definition of “gaming machine”) to Group 4 of Schedule 9,
for “coin or token” substitute *“ coin, token or other thing .


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2003/14/section/9/4
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2007/11
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2007/11/schedule/27/part/6/3

12 Finance Act 2003 (c. 14)
Part 1 — Wine and made-wine of a strength not exceeding 22 per cent
Document Generated: 2024-08-29

Status: Point in time view as at 01/07/2012.
Changes to legislation: Finance Act 2003, Part 1 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or
before 29 August 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have
been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

11 Amusement machines: use of currencies other than sterling

(1) In section 26 of the Betting and Gaming Duties Act 1981 (c. 63) (interpretation etc),
omit the definition of “coin” in subsection (2).

(2) After that section insert—

“26A Amounts in currencies other than sterling

(1) Any reference in this Part of this Act to a amount in sterling, in the context
of—
(a) the cost of playing a game, or
(b) the amount of the prize for a game,
includes a reference to the equivalent amount in another currency.

(2) The equivalent amount in another currency, in relation to any day, shall be
determined by reference to the London closing exchange rate for the previous
day.

(3) For the purposes of determining what duty is payable on an amusement
machine licence in a case where this section applies, the equivalent in another
currency of an amount in sterling shall be taken to be its equivalent on the day
on which the application for the licence is received by the Commissioners, or
the due date in the case of a default licence.

(4) In subsection (3) above—

“default licence” means a licence granted under paragraph 3(1) of
Schedule 4A to this Act;

“due date” has the meaning given by paragraph 2(4) of that
Schedule.”.

(3) This section does not apply in relation to any amusement machine licence granted
before the day on which this Act is passed or to anything done under such a licence.

12 Responsibility for unlicensed amusement machines

(1) In section 24(5) of the Betting and Gaming Duties Act 1981 (c. 63) (penalty for
unlicensed amusement machines), for paragraph (c) (liability of person responsible
for, inter alia, issuing or exchanging coins etc for amusement machine) substitute—

“(c) 1is a person responsible for controlling the use of any amusement
machine on the premises, or”.

(2) In Schedule 4A to that Act (unlicensed amusement machines), for paragraph (c) of
paragraph 7(3) (which makes similar provision) substitute—

“(c) responsible for controlling the use of any amusement machine on the
premises, or”.

13 Rates of gaming duty

(1) For the Table in section 11(2) of the Finance Act 1997 (c. 16) (rates of gaming duty)
substitute—



Finance Act 2003 (c. 14) 13
Part 1 — Wine and made-wine of a strength not exceeding 22 per cent
Document Generated: 2024-08-29

Status: Point in time view as at 01/07/2012.
Changes to legislation: Finance Act 2003, Part 1 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or
before 29 August 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have
been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

“TABLE
Part of gross gaming yield Rate
The first £502,500 2.5 per cent.
The next £1,115,500 12.5 per cent.
The next £1,115,500 20 per cent.
The next £1,953,000 30 per cent.
The remainder 40 per cent.”

(2) This section has effect in relation to accounting periods beginning on or after 1st April
2003.

Vehicle excise duty

14 Vehicle excise duty: rates

(1) In paragraph 1 of Schedule 1 to the Vehicle Excise and Registration Act 1994 (c. 22)
(the general rate)—

B )

(b) insub-paragraph (2A) (general rate of duty in case of vehicle with engine with
cylinder capacity not exceeding 1,549 cubic centimetres) for “£105” substitute
“£110 7.

(3) In paragraph 1J of that Schedule (rates of duty applicable to light goods vehicles first
registered on or after 1st March 2001)—
(a) in paragraph (a) (vehicle which is not a lower-emission van) for “£160”
substitute “ £165 ’;
(b) inparagraph (b) (vehicle which is a lower-emission van) for “£105” substitute
“£110 7.

(4) This section applies to any licence taken out on or after 17th April 2003 for a period
beginning on or after 1st May 2003.

Textual Amendments
F2  S. 14(1)(a) repealed (7.4.2005) by Finance Act 2005 (c. 7), Sch. 11 Pt. 1
F3  S. 14(2) repealed (7.4.2005) by Finance Act 2005 (c. 7), Sch. 11 Pt. 1

15 Disclosure for exemptions: Northern Ireland

In section 22ZA of the Vehicle Excise and Registration Act 1994 (c. 22) (nil licences
for vehicles for disabled persons: disclosure of information) in subsection (1)(a)
(which provides that the section applies to certain information held by the Secretary
of State or a person providing services to him) in sub-paragraphs (i) and (ii), after “the
Secretary of State” insert ““ or a Northern Ireland department ™.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2003/14/section/14/1/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2005/7
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2005/7/schedule/11/part/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2003/14/section/14/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2005/7
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2005/7/schedule/11/part/1

14 Finance Act 2003 (c. 14)
Part 1 — Wine and made-wine of a strength not exceeding 22 per cent
Document Generated: 2024-08-29

Status: Point in time view as at 01/07/2012.
Changes to legislation: Finance Act 2003, Part 1 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or
before 29 August 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have
been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

16 Duty at higher rate: exception for tractive units

(1) After section 15 of the Vehicle Excise and Registration Act 1994 insert—

“15A Exception for tractive units from charge at higher rate

(1) Where—
(a) avehicle licence has been taken out for a tractive unit, and

(b) the licence was taken out at a rate of vehicle excise duty applicable to
a tractive unit which is to be used with semi-trailers with a minimum
number of axles,

duty at a higher rate does not become chargeable under section 15 by reason
only that while the licence is in force the tractive unit is used with a semi-trailer
with fewer axles than that minimum number, if the condition in subsection (2)
is satisfied.

(2) The condition is that the rate of duty at which the licence was taken out is
equal to or exceeds the rate which would have been applicable if the revenue
weight of the tractive unit had been a weight equal to the actual laden weight,
at the time of the use, of the articulated vehicle consisting of the tractive unit
and the semi-trailer.”.

(2) Section 16 of that Act (which makes provision, in the case of tractive units, for
exemptions from the charge to vehicle excise duty at a higher rate on a basis different
from that set out in new section 15A) shall cease to have effect.

(3) This section has effect in relation to the use of a tractive unit on or after 9th April 2003.



Finance Act 2003 (c. 14)
Document Generated: 2024-08-29

15

Status:
Point in time view as at 01/07/2012.

Changes to legislation:

Finance Act 2003, Part 1 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or before 29
August 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that
have been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations.




