
Status: Point in time view as at 01/12/2020. This version of this provision has been superseded.
Changes to legislation: Companies Act 2006, Section 1250 is up to date with all changes known to be in force

on or before 30 July 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that
have been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

Companies Act 2006
2006 CHAPTER 46

PART 42

STATUTORY AUDITORS

CHAPTER 6

SUPPLEMENTARY AND GENERAL

False and misleading statements

1250 Misleading, false and deceptive statements

(1) A person is guilty of an offence if—
(a) for the purposes of or in connection with any application under this Part, or
(b) in purported compliance with any requirement imposed on him by or by virtue

of this Part,
he knowingly or recklessly furnishes information which is misleading, false or
deceptive in a material particular.

(2) It is an offence for a person whose name does not appear on the register of auditors
kept under regulations under section 1239 in an entry made under subsection (1)(a) of
that section to describe himself as a registered auditor or so to hold himself out as to
indicate, or be reasonably understood to indicate, that he is a registered auditor.

(3) It is an offence for a person whose name does not appear on the register of auditors kept
under regulations under that section in an entry made under subsection (1)(b) of that
section to describe himself as a registered third country auditor or so to hold himself
out as to indicate, or be reasonably understood to indicate, that he is a registered third
country auditor.



2 Companies Act 2006 (c. 46)
Part 42 – Statutory Auditors

Chapter 6 – Supplementary and general
Document Generated: 2024-07-30

Status: Point in time view as at 01/12/2020. This version of this provision has been superseded.
Changes to legislation: Companies Act 2006, Section 1250 is up to date with all changes known to be in force

on or before 30 July 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that
have been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(4) It is an offence for a body which is not a recognised supervisory body or a recognised
qualifying body to describe itself as so recognised or so to describe itself or hold itself
out as to indicate, or be reasonably understood to indicate, that it is so recognised.

(5) A person guilty of an offence under subsection (1) is liable—
(a) on conviction on indictment, to imprisonment for a term not exceeding two

years or to a fine (or both);
(b) on summary conviction—

(i) in England and Wales, to imprisonment for a term not exceeding
twelve months or to a fine not exceeding the statutory maximum (or
both),

(ii) in Scotland or Northern Ireland, to imprisonment for a term not
exceeding six months or to a fine not exceeding the statutory
maximum (or both).

In relation to an offence committed before the commencement of [F1paragraph 24(2)
of Schedule 22 to the Sentencing Act 2020], for “twelve months” in paragraph (b)(i)
substitute “six months”.

(6) Subject to subsection (7), a person guilty of an offence under subsection (2), (3) or (4)
is liable on summary conviction—

(a) in England and Wales, to imprisonment for a term not exceeding 51 weeks or
to a fine not exceeding level 5 on the standard scale (or both),

(b) in Scotland or Northern Ireland, to imprisonment for a term not exceeding six
months or to a fine not exceeding level 5 on the standard scale (or both).

In relation to an offence committed before the commencement of section 281(5) of the
Criminal Justice Act 2003, for “51 weeks” in paragraph (a) substitute “six months”.

(7) Where a contravention of subsection (2), (3) or (4) involves a public display of the
offending description, the maximum fine that may be imposed is an amount equal to
level 5 on the standard scale multiplied by the number of days for which the display
has continued.

(8) It is a defence for a person charged with an offence under subsection (2), (3) or (4) to
show that he took all reasonable precautions and exercised all due diligence to avoid
the commission of the offence.

Textual Amendments
F1 Words in s. 1250(5) substituted (1.12.2020) by Sentencing Act 2020 (c. 17), s. 416(1), Sch. 24 para.

443(1) (with Sch. 24 para. 447, Sch. 27); S.I. 2020/1236, reg. 2

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2006/46/section/1250/5
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2020/17
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2020/17/section/416/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2020/17/schedule/24/paragraph/443/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2020/17/schedule/24/paragraph/443/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2020/17/schedule/24/paragraph/447
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2020/17/schedule/27
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/1236
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2020/1236/regulation/2


Companies Act 2006 (c. 46)
Document Generated: 2024-07-30

3

Status: 
Point in time view as at 01/12/2020. This version of this provision has been superseded.

Changes to legislation: 
Companies Act 2006, Section 1250 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or
before 30 July 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes
that have been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations.


