
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk editorial
team to Finance Act 2014. Any changes that have already been made by the team appear in the content

and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details) View outstanding changes

Finance Act 2014
2014 CHAPTER 26

PART 2

EXCISE DUTIES AND OTHER TAXES

Climate change levy

97 Climate change levy: carbon price support rates for 2014-15 and 2015-16

(1) Paragraph 42A of Schedule 6 to FA 2000 (climate change levy: carbon price support
rates) is amended as follows.

(2) In the table in sub-paragraph (3), as substituted by paragraph 23 of Schedule 42 to FA
2013, for “ £0.85489 per gigajoule ” substitute “£0.81906 per gigajoule”.

(3) The amendment made by subsection (2) has effect in relation to supplies treated as
taking place on or after 1 April 2014.

(4) In the table in sub-paragraph (3), as substituted by paragraph 24 of Schedule 42 to FA
2013, for “ £1.62534 per gigajoule ” substitute “£1.56860 per gigajoule”.

(5) The amendment made by subsection (4) has effect in relation to supplies treated as
taking place on or after 1 April 2015.



2 Finance Act 2014 (c. 26)
Document Generated: 2024-05-12

Changes to legislation: 
There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk editorial team to Finance
Act 2014. Any changes that have already been made by the team appear in the content and are
referenced with annotations.
View outstanding changes

Changes and effects yet to be applied to the whole Act associated Parts and Chapters:
Whole provisions yet to be inserted into this Act (including any effects on those
provisions):
– s. 212(4)(f) and word inserted by 2021 c. 26 Sch. 27 para. 43(b)(ii)
– s. 212(5)(a)(iv) and word inserted by 2021 c. 26 Sch. 27 para. 43(c)(ii)
– s. 212(5)(b)(iv) and word inserted by 2021 c. 26 Sch. 27 para. 43(c)(iv)
– s. 212(5)(c)(iv) and word inserted by 2021 c. 26 Sch. 27 para. 43(c)(v)
– s. 227A227B inserted by 2024 c. 3 s. 34(1)
– Sch. 31 para. 2(3)(b) inserted by 2017 c. 32 Sch. 14 para. 45(2)(a)(iii)
– Sch. 31 para. 2(4A) inserted by 2017 c. 32 Sch. 14 para. 45(2)(c)
– Sch. 31 para. 3(1A) inserted by 2017 c. 32 Sch. 14 para. 45(3)(b)
– Sch. 31 para. 5(b) inserted by 2017 c. 32 Sch. 14 para. 45(4)(c)
– Sch. 31 para. 2(3)(a) words inserted by 2017 c. 32 Sch. 14 para. 45(2)(a)(ii)
– Sch. 31 para. 5(a) words inserted by 2017 c. 32 Sch. 14 para. 45(4)(b)
– Sch. 31 para. 2(3)(a) words renumbered as Sch. 31 para. 2(3)(a) by 2017 c. 32 Sch.

14 para. 45(2)(a)(i)
– Sch. 31 para. 5(a) words renumbered as Sch. 31 para. 5(a) by 2017 c. 32 Sch. 14

para. 45(4)(a)
– Sch. 32 para. 1(2)(b) inserted by 2017 c. 32 Sch. 14 para. 46(2)(a)(iii)
– Sch. 32 para. 1(3A) inserted by 2017 c. 32 Sch. 14 para. 46(2)(c)
– Sch. 32 para. 1(2)(a) words inserted by 2017 c. 32 Sch. 14 para. 46(2)(a)(ii)
– Sch. 32 para. 1(2)(a) words renumbered as Sch. 32 para. 1(2)(a) by 2017 c. 32 Sch.

14 para. 46(2)(a)(i)

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2021/26
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2021/26/schedule/27
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2021/26/schedule/27/paragraph/43/b/ii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2021/26
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2021/26/schedule/27
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2021/26/schedule/27/paragraph/43/c/ii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2021/26
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2021/26/schedule/27
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2021/26/schedule/27/paragraph/43/c/iv
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2021/26
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2021/26/schedule/27
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2021/26/schedule/27/paragraph/43/c/v
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/section/34/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14/paragraph/45/2/a/iii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14/paragraph/45/2/c
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14/paragraph/45/3/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14/paragraph/45/4/c
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14/paragraph/45/2/a/ii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14/paragraph/45/4/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14/paragraph/45/2/a/i
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14/paragraph/45/4/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14/paragraph/46/2/a/iii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14/paragraph/46/2/c
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14/paragraph/46/2/a/ii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2017/32/schedule/14/paragraph/46/2/a/i

