
Finance Act 2020 (c. 14)
SCHEDULE 3 – Entrepreneurs' relief
Document Generated: 2024-06-27

1

Status: Point in time view as at 22/07/2020.
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Finance
Act 2020, Cross Heading: Reduction in lifetime limit. (See end of Document for details)

S C H E D U L E S

SCHEDULE 3

ENTREPRENEURS' RELIEF

PART 1

REDUCTION IN LIFETIME LIMIT

Reduction in lifetime limit
1 In section 169N of TCGA 1992 (entrepreneurs' relief: amount of relief)—

(a) in subsection (4), for “£10 million” substitute “ £1 million ”;
(b) in subsection (4A), for “£10 million” substitute “ £1 million ”.



2 Finance Act 2020 (c. 14)
Document Generated: 2024-06-27

Status: 
Point in time view as at 22/07/2020.

Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Finance Act 2020, Cross Heading:
Reduction in lifetime limit.


