5353

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1983 No. 1681 (L.25)
COUNTY COURTS
The County Court Fees (Amendment) Order 1983

Made - - - 14th November 1983
Laid before Parliament 15th November 1983
Coming into Operation 12th December 1983

The Lord Chancellor, in exercise of the powers conferred on him by section 177 of
the County Courts Act 1959(a), with the concurrence of the Treasury, hereby
makes the following Order:—

1. (1) This Order may be cited as the County Court Fees (Amendment) Order
1983 and shall come into operation on 12th December 1983.

(2) A fee or column referred to by number means the fee or column so
numbered in Schedule 1 to the County Court Fees Order 1982(b).

2. Incolumn 2 (amount of fee) —

(a) in Fee 1(i), for “£57, “£32”, “£34”, and “£35” there shall be substituted
“£6”, “£35”, “£38”, and “£40” respectively;

(b) in Fee 1(ii), for “£15” there shall be substituted “£20”;
(c) inFee 2, for “£4” there shall be substituted “£5”’;

(d) in Fee 4(i), for “£3.50” and “£25” there shall be substituted “£5” and
“£30” respectively;

(e) inFee 4(ii), for “£5” there shall be substituted “£6”;
(f) in Fee 4(vi), for the whole entry there shall be substituted “£10”*;

(g) in Fee 4(vii), for “£2.50” and “£15” there shall be substituted “£5”’ and
“£20” respectively;

(h) inFee 7(ii)(b), for “£17” there shall be substituted “£20”.

3. Incolumn 3 (method of charging fee) —
(@) under Fee 1(ii), for “£35” there shall be substituted “£40”;
(b) under Fee 4(iii), the whole note shall be omitted;
(c) under Fee 4(viii), the whole note shall be omitted.

(a) 1959¢.22. (b) S.1. 1982/1706.



5354 COUNTY COURTS

4. Fee 4(iv) shall be omitted and the following substituted: —

“@v) By the issue of a | £20 | 4.(iv) Where the recovery of a sum of

warrant of possession . . . money, other than this fee, is sought in
addition, the appropriate fee under Fee
4(i) is also payable.”

Hailsham of St. Marylebone, C.
Dated 4th November 1983.

Alastair Goodlad,
D. J. F. Hunt,
Two of the Lords Commissioners
of Her Majesty’s Treasury.
Dated 14th November 1983.

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This Note is not part of the Order.)

This Order increases a number of fees, in particular, those payable on the issue
of proceedings and on various types of enforcement process.

SI 1983/1681
ISBN 0-11-037681-1

40110376813



	
	

