
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1987 No. 1753

The Police (Amendment) Regulations 1987

3. The Police Regulations 1979(1) (as they continue to have effect in relation to the period prior
to their revocation by the Police Regulations 1987(2)) shall be deemed to have been amended as
follows —

(a) in regulation 36 (London weighting) and paragraph 3(2) of Schedule 4 (university
scholars) for the words “£885” there shall be deemed to have been substituted the words
“£945”;

(b) in regulation 48(3) (a) and (b) (supplementary rent allowance) for the words “£8.33” there
shall be deemed to have been substituted the words “£13.92”.

(1) S.I.1979/1470; the relevant amending instruments are S.I. 1980/405, 803, 1981/41, 1982/271, 1983/160, 812, 1985/885,
1986/784

(2) S.I. 1987/851

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1979/1470
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1980/405
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1980/803
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1981/41
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1982/271
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1983/160
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1983/812
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1985/885
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1986/784
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1987/851

