
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1991 No. 1349

The National Health Service (General Dental
Services) (Scotland) Amendment Regulations 1991

Amendment of the principal Regulations

2.—(1)  The principal Regulations shall be amended in accordance with the following paragraphs
of this regulation.

(2)  In paragraph 16(2) of Schedule 1 (terms of service for dentists)–
(a) after head (m) there is inserted the following head:–

“(mm) any treatment immediately necessary as a result of trauma;”;
(b) in head (n) after “(f)” there are inserted the words “and (mm)”;
(c) in head (o) for the words “and (k)” there are substituted the words “, (k) and (mm)”;
(d) in head (p) after “(k)” there are inserted the words “and (mm)”; and
(e) in head (q) for the words “and (m)” there are substituted the words “, (m) and (mm)”.

(3)  In Part II of Schedule 1C (prior approval treatment)–
(a) in paragraph 1 (course of care and treatment) for “£500” there is substituted “£600”; and
(b) in paragraph 2 (orthodontic care and treatment) for “£500” there is substituted “£600”.


