
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1991 No. 1525

The Motor Vehicles (Tests)
(Amendment) (No. 3) Regulations 1991

Amendments coming into force on 1st November 1991

9. In regulation 20–
(a) in paragraph (1), as substituted by regulation 4(a) above–

(i) in sub-paragraph (c) for “£16.65” there shall be substituted “£20.00”; and
(ii) in sub-paragraph (f) for “£19.30” there shall be substituted “£22.60”; and

(b) in paragraph (3A)(b), as inserted by regulation 4(c) above, before paragraph (iii) there
shall be inserted “(iiA) emissions,”.

[DET 1855]


