Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1993 No. 2527
POLICE

The Police (Amendment) (No. 4) Regulations 1993

Made - - - - 16th October 1993
Laid before Parliament 28th October 1993

22nd November
Coming into force - - 1993

In exercise of the powers conferred on me by section 33 of the Police Act 1964(1), after taking into
consideration the recommendations made by the Police Negotiating Board for the United Kingdom
and furnishing the said Board with a draft of the Regulations in accordance with section 2(1) of the
Police Negotiating Board Act 1980(2), I hereby make the following Regulations:

Citation, commencement and interpretation.

1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Police (Amendment) (No. 4) Regulations 1993
and shall come into force on 22nd November 1993, but regulation 2 shall have effect as from 1st
April 1993 and regulations 3 and 4 shall have effect as from 1st September 1993.

(2) In these Regulations “the principal Regulations” means the Police Regulations 1987(3).

Removal allowance

2. Regulation 53(7) of the principal Regulations is amended by substituting for the figure
“£1,257” the figure “£1,290”.

Scales of pay

3. Schedule 5 to the principal Regulations is amended by substituting for Tables A and B the
tables set out in the Schedule to these Regulations.

Dog handler’s allowance

4. Schedule 11 to the principal Regulations is amended by substituting for the figure “£915” the
figure “£930” and for the figure “£1,251” the figure “£1,269”.

(1) 1964 c. 48.
(2) 1980c. 10.
(3) 1987/851; relevant amendments were made by S. 1.1993/313.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1964/48
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1980/10
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1987/851
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1993/313

Document Generated: 2023-06-27
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Michael Howard
Home Office One of Her Majesty’s Principal Secretaries of
16th October 1993 State



Document Generated: 2023-06-27

Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCHEDULE
TABLE A
Annual pay
Rank Service in rank London Provinces
£ £
Chief Superintendent  Less than 1 year 40,071 40,071
After 1 year 40,644 40,644
After 2 years 41,556 41,556
After 3 years 42,549 42,549
Superintendent Less than 1 year 36,960 36,042
After 1 year 37,686 36,960
After 2 years 38,406 37,875
After 3 years 39,135 39,135
Chief Inspector Less than 1 year 27,768 26,496
After 1 year 28,446 27,237
After 2 years 29,181 27,978
After 3 years 29,958 28,722
After 4 years 30,732 29,472
Inspector Less than 1 year 24,591 23,337
After 1 year 25,278 24,066
After 2 years 26,172 25,005
After 3 years 26,976 25,749
After 4 years 27,768 26,496
Sergeant Less than 1 year 20,343 20,343
After 1 year 21,267 21,267
After 2 years 22,014 22,014
After 3 years 22,743 22,743
After 4 years 23,337 23,337
TABLE B

Annual pay of constables

Reckonable Service Annual pay
£

Before completing 1 year of service 12,744

After 1 year of service 13,626



Document Generated: 2023-06-27
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Reckonable Service Annual pay
£
After 2 years of service 16,044
After 3 years of service 16,422
After 4 years of service 16,965
After 5 years of service 17,547
After 6 years of service 18,105
After 7 years of service 18,666
After 8 years of service 19,218
After 12 years of service 20,343
After 15 years of service 21,267
EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulation)

These Regulations further amend the Police Regulations 1987. Regulation 2 increases, with effect
from 1st April 1993, the maximum amount of removal allowance payable in respect of incidental
expenses. Regulation 3 increases pay, and regulation 4 increases the dog handler’s allowance, both
with effect from 1st September 1993. Retrospection is authorised by section 33(4) of the Police Act
1964.



