
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1994 No. 805

The Legal Advice and Assistance
(Amendment) Regulations 1994

Amendments of the Legal Advice and Assistance Regulations 1989

7. Regulation 12 shall be amended as follows:—
(a) in paragraphs (1), (2) and (5) for “£61” there shall be substituted “£63”;
(b) in paragraph (1) for “£147” there shall be substituted “£153”;
(c) in paragraph (5) after “contribution” there shall be inserted “towards the cost of ABWOR”;
(d) after paragraph (5) there shall be inserted the following:—

“(6)  A client shall in no case be liable to pay any contribution towards the cost of advice
and assistance other than ABWOR.”.


