
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1994 No. 806

The Civil Legal Aid (Assessment of
Resources) (Amendment) Regulations 1994

Amendments of the Civil Legal Aid (Assessment of Resources) Regulations 1989

4.—(1)  In regulation 4(2) for “£6,800” there shall be substituted “£7,060”.
(2)  In regulation 4(3) for “£7,500” there shall be substituted “£7,780”.
(3)  In regulation 4(4)(a) for “£2294” there shall be substituted “£2,382”.


