
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1995 No. 1488

ROAD TRAFFIC

The Goods Vehicles (Operators' Licences, Qualifications
and Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 1995

Made       -      -      -      - 8th June 1995

Laid before Parliament 9th June 1995

Coming into force       -      - 1st July 1995

The Secretary of State for Transport, in exercise of the powers conferred by sections 60(2)(b), 89(1)
and 91(1) of the Transport Act 1968(1), and now vested in him(2), and the Department of Transport
(Fees) Order 1988(3), and of all other powers enabling him in that behalf, and after consultation
with representative organisations in accordance with section 91(8) of that Act, hereby makes the
following Regulations:—

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Goods Vehicles (Operators' Licences, Qualifications
and Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 1995 and shall come into force on 1st July 1995.

2. The Goods Vehicles (Operators' Licences, Qualifications and Fees) Regulations 1984(4) shall
be further amended in accordance with the following provisions of these Regulations.

3.—(1)  In regulation 3(2)—
(a) in the definition of “keeper”, for the words “the Vehicles (Excise) Act 1971” there shall

be substituted “the Vehicle Excise and Registration Act 1994” (5);
(b) in the definition of “recovery vehicle”, for the words “Part I of Schedule 3 to the Vehicles

(Excise) Act 1971” there shall be substituted “Part V of Schedule 1 to the Vehicle Excise
and Registration Act 1994”;

(1) 1968 c. 73: section 89(1) was amended by Part II of Schedule 9 to the Transport Act 1980 (c. 34) ("the 1980 Act"), and by
Schedule 6 to the Transport Act 1982 (c. 49) ("the 1982" Act); section 91(1) was amended by Part II of Schedule 9 to the
1980 Act, and by Part II of Schedule 4 to the 1982 Act; and section 91(8) was amended by Schedule 6 of the 1982 Act.

(2) S.I. 1979/1681, 1979/571 and 1981/238.
(3) S.I. 1988/643, which was made under the Finance (No. 2) Act 1987 (c. 51). The relevant reference in S.I. 1988/643 is Table

I of Schedule 1.
(4) S.I. 1984/176; relevant amending instruments are S.I. 1986/666, 1987/841 and 2170, 1988/2128, 1991/1969 and 2239,

1993/301 and 1994/1209.
(5) 1994 c. 22. Paragraph 4 of Schedule 1 is amended by paragraph 9(4) of Schedule 4 to the Finance Act 1995 (c. 4). Paragraph

17 of Schedule 3 is repealed by paragraph 2 of Schedule 4 and by Part V of Schedule 27 to that Act.
[DOT 0609]

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1968/73
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1980/34
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1982/49
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1979/1681
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1979/571
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1981/238
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1988/643
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1987/51
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1988/643
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1984/176
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1986/666
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1987/841
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1987/2170
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1988/2128
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1991/1969
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1991/2239
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1993/301
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1994/1209
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1994/22
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1995/4


Document Generated: 2023-06-26
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(c) in the definition of “showman’s goods vehicle”, for the words “Schedule 4 to the Vehicles
(Excise) Act 1971” there shall be substituted “section 62(1) of the Vehicle Excise and
Registration Act 1994”;

(d) in the definition of “tower wagon”, for the words “section 4(2) of the Vehicles (Excise)
Act 1971” there shall be substituted “paragraph 17 of Schedule 2 to the Vehicle Excise
and Registration Act 1994 as originally enacted”; and

(e) in the definition of “trade licence” for the words “section 38(1) of the Vehicles (Excise)
Act 1971” there shall be substituted “section 62(1) of the Vehicle Excise and Registration
Act 1994”.

4. In regulation 35(1A)—
(a) for the words “1st June 1994” there shall be substituted the words “1st July 1995”, and
(b) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£8” there shall be substituted “£8.50”.

5. In regulation 35(1B)—
(a) for the words “1st June 1994” there shall be substituted the words “1st July 1995”, and
(b) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£8” there shall be substituted “£8.50”.

6. In paragraph 1 of Part I of Schedule 5, for the words “paragraph 2 of Part I of Schedule 3 to
the Vehicles (Excise) Act 1971” there shall be substituted “paragraph 4(3) of Part IV of Schedule 1
to the Vehicle Excise and Registration Act 1994 as originally enacted”.

7. Nothing in regulation 4 or 5 of these Regulations affects the fee payable in respect of the grant
or variation of a licence before 1st July 1995.

Signed by authority of the Secretary of State for Transport

Department of Transport
8th June 1995

Steven Norris
Parliamentary Under Secretary of State,

2



Document Generated: 2023-06-26
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

These Regulations further amend the Goods Vehicles (Operators' Licences, Qualifications and Fees)
Regulations 1984.
They replace references to, or to the provisions of, the Vehicles (Excise) Act 1971 with references to,
or the equivalent provisions of, the Vehicle Excise and Registration Act 1994. Where, on the date on
which these Regulations come into force the equivalent provisions of the 1994 Act will be repealed
by virtue of amendments made in Schedule 4 to the Finance Act 1995, the substituted references are
to the provisions of the 1994 Act as originally enacted.
They make the following amendments as respects fees. The relevant fees were last amended with
effect from 1st June 1994 by S.I. 1994/1209.
The fee prescribed in respect of the grant of a goods vehicle operator’s licence on or after 1st July
1995 is increased from £8 to £8.50 in respect of each specified vehicle.
The fee prescribed in respect of a variation of a licence on or after 1st July 1995 is increased from £8
to £8.50 for each additional vehicle where the variation results in an addition to the highest number
of specified vehicles between the grant of the licence and the variation.

3

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1994/1209

