
Document Generated: 2023-10-20
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCHEDULE Regulations 8 and 21

Minor Amendments to the Jobseeker’s Allowance Regulations 1996

Regulation Amendment
PART I

26(b) For the words “regulation 25(a) or (b)” there
shall be substituted the words “regulation 25(1)
(a) or (b)”.

26(c) For the words “regulation 25(c)” there shall be
substituted the words “regulation 25(1)(c)”.

66(2) For the words “regulation 61(2) or 61(3)” there
shall be substituted the words “regulation 62(2)
or 62(3)”.

PART II
1(3) In the definition of “relevant enactment” for

the words “regulation 78(8)(a)” there shall be
substituted the words “regulation 78(9)(a)”.

51(3)(c)(iii) After the words “another person” there shall be
inserted the word “and”.

52(3) For the words “regulation 98(1)(b) and
(d)” there shall be substituted the words
“regulation 98(1)(b) and (c)”.

53(h)(ii) After the word “hours” there shall be inserted
the word “of”.

78(5)(b) For the words “regulation 50(4)” there shall be
substituted the words “regulation 50(5)”.

78(6) For the word “should” there shall be substituted
the word “shall”.

78(7) For the words “sub-paragraphs (d) or (i)” there
shall be substituted the words “sub-paragraphs
(d), (f) or (i)”.

84(1)(b) For the words “sub-paragraphs (3)(d)” there
shall be substituted the words “sub-paragraphs
(3)(e)”.

85(4) In the first of the definitions of “person from
abroad”, in paragraph (a), for the words
“11th December 1953), a state” there shall be
substituted the words “11th December 1953) or
a state”.

87(5)(b) For the words “paragraph 10(5)” there shall be
substituted the words “paragraph 10(4)”.

87(5)(c) For the words “paragraph 10(5)” there shall be
substituted the words “paragraph 10(4)”.

1



Document Generated: 2023-10-20
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Regulation Amendment
87(7) In sub-paragraph (2B) for the words

“Paragraph (2)(b) or (2)(c)” there shall be
substituted the words “Paragraph (2A)(b) or
(2A)(c)”.

88(3) For the words “paragraph 1(3)(b), (c), (f)
or (g)” there shall be substituted the words
“paragraph 1(3)(b), (c), (g) or (h)”.

88(3)(b) For the words “paragraph 1(3)(f) or (g)” there
shall be substituted the words “paragraph 1(3)
(g) or (h)”.

131(2)(f) The words “(other than special equipment)”
shall be omitted.

140(1)(h)(i) For the words “section 72(3)” there shall be
substituted the words “section 72(4)”.

140(1)(h)(ii) For the words “paragraph (6)” there shall be
substituted the words “paragraph (5)”.

140(2) The words “or (4)” shall be omitted.

149(2) For the word “consists” there shall be
substituted the word “consist”.

163(3) In regulation 101(11), as substituted by
regulation 163(3), for the word “and” on the
first occasion on which it occurs, there shall
be substituted the word “an” and for the word
“usually” there shall be substituted the word
“unusually”.

166(2) For the word “treated” there shall be substituted
the word “regarded”.

171(b)(ii) For the words “incapable or work” there shall
be substituted the words “incapable of work”.

Schedule 1, paragraph 1(2)(c) After the words “paragraph 13(a)” there shall
be inserted the words “of Part 3”.

Schedule 1, paragraph 14(1)(g)(ii) For the words “the claimant or his partner”
there shall be substituted the words “the
partner”.

Schedule 1, paragraph 20(6)(b)(i) For the words “if he or any partner” there shall
be substituted the words “if any partner of the
claimant”.

Schedule 2, paragraph 1(3)(c) For the word “Regulation” there shall be
substituted the word “Regulations”.

Schedule 2, paragraph 2(1)(b) For the words “in not meeting them” there shall
be substituted the words “is not meeting them”.

Schedule 2, paragraph 3(11)(c)(x) For the word “this” there shall be substituted
the word “his”.

2



Document Generated: 2023-10-20
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Regulation Amendment
Schedule 2, paragraph 7(4) For the words “sub-paragraph (6)” there shall

be substituted the words “sub-paragraph (7)”.

Schedule 2, paragraph 7(5) For the words “heads (i) to (iii) of sub-
paragraph (e)” there shall be substituted the
words “heads (i) to (iv) of sub-paragraph (c)”.

Schedule 2, paragraph 10(1)(b) For the word “provision” there shall be
substituted the word “provisions”.

Schedule 2, paragraph 10(9) For the words “paragraphs 15 and 16” there
shall be substituted the words “paragraphs 14
and 15”.

Schedule 2, paragraph 13(1) For the word “purpose” there shall be
substituted the word “purposes”.

Schedule 4, paragraph 8(3) For the words “shall be the amount” there shall
be substituted the words “shall be the lesser or
least amount”.

chedule 4, paragraph 10(4)(b)(iii) For the words “section 35” there shall be
substituted the words section 64.

Schedule 5, column (1), paragraph 1 For the words “2 and 17” there shall be
substituted the words “2, 15 and 17”.

Schedule 5, column (2), paragraph 2(a) For the words “regulation 83(b)” there shall be
substituted the words “regulation 83 or 84” and
for the words “regulation 84(1)(c)” there shall
be substituted the words “regulation 83(b) or
84(1)(c)”.

Schedule 5, column (2), paragraph 8(2) For the sum “£58.85” there shall be substituted
the sum “£61.15”.

Schedule 5, column (2), paragraph 8(3) For the sum “£58.85” there shall be substituted
the sum “£61.15” and for the words “84(i)(g)”
there shall be substituted the words “84(1)(g)”.

Schedule 5, column (1), paragraph 11(1)(b) For the words “Great Britain” there shall be
substituted the words “United Kingdom”.

Schedule 5, column (1), paragraph 13(1) For the words–
“(c)   two or more partners are,

absent from the United Kingdom in
the circumstances specified in sub-
paragraph (2).

had claimed a jobseeker’s
allowance.”,

there shall be substituted the words–
“(c)   two or more of his partners are,

absent from the United Kingdom in
the circumstances specified in sub-
paragraph (2).”.

3



Document Generated: 2023-10-20
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Regulation Amendment
Schedule 5, column (1), paragraph 13(2)(c) For the words “if he” there shall be substituted

the words “if he had claimed a jobseeker’s
allowance.”.

Schedule 5, column (2), paragraph 14(b)(i) The words “(e) and” shall be omitted.

Schedule 5, column (2), paragraph 14(d) For the words “83(1)(e)” there shall be
substituted the words “83(e)”.

Schedule 5, column (2), paragraph 15(1)(b) For the word “his” there shall be substituted the
word “this”.

Schedule 5, column (2), paragraph 17(b)(ii) For the words “of polygamous” there shall be
substituted the words “or polygamous”.

Schedule 6, paragraph 1(a)(ii) For the words “regulation 98(1)(b), (c), (f)
and (g)” there shall be substituted the words
“regulation 98(1)(b), (c), (d), (f) and (g)”.

Schedule 7, paragraph 23(1) After the word “income” where it appears for
the second time, the word “derived” shall be
inserted.

4


