
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2000 No. 3148

The Firearms (Variation of Fees) Order 2000

3.—(1)  Section 32(1) of the 1968 Act(1) (fees for firearm and shot gun certificates) is amended
as follows.

(2)  In paragraph (a), for “£56” substitute “£50”.
(3)  In paragraph (b), for “£46” substitute “£40”.
(4)  In paragraph (d), for “£43” substitute “£50”.
(5)  In paragraph (e), for “£18” substitute “£40”.

(1) Section 32(1) was amended by the Firearms (Variation of Fees) Order 1994 (S.I.1994/2615) and the Firearms (Variation of
Fees) (Scotland) Order 1994 (S.I. 1994/2652 (S.134)).

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1994/2615
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1994/2652

