
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2000 No. 630

The Wireless Telegraphy (Television Licence
Fees) (Amendment) Regulations 2000

Citation, commencement and interpretation

1.—(1)  These Regulations may be cited as the Wireless Telegraphy (Television Licence Fees)
(Amendment) Regulations 2000 and shall come into force on 1st April 2000.

(2)  In these Regulations “the 1997 Regulations” means the Wireless Telegraphy (Television
Licence Fees) Regulations 1997(1).

Amendment of 1997 Regulations

2.—(1)  The 1997 Regulations shall be amended in accordance with this regulation.
(2)  In regulation 2 there shall be inserted at the end–

“(c)   “the due date” in relation to any television licence means the date on which the
licensee is required to obtain the licence in accordance with the Wireless Telegraphy Act
1949 whether in consequence of the expiry of the previous licence or otherwise.”.

(3)  In regulation 4 there shall be inserted at the end–
“(3)  On the issue of a television licence of a type specified in an entry in column 1 of

Schedule 4 to these Regulations and of the description specified in column 2 of that Schedule
in relation to that entry, there shall be paid (irrespective of the duration of the licence) as the
issue fee for a licence of that type and description the sum which is prescribed in column
3 of that Schedule in respect of that entry and thereafter as instalment payments such sums
as are so prescribed.”.

(4)  In Part I of Schedule 2–
(a) for “£33.50” in each place where it occurs there shall be substituted “ £34.50”, and
(b) for “£101.00” in each place where it occurs there shall be substituted “£104.00”.

(5)  In Part II of Schedule 2–
(a) for the words “of pensionable age” in each place where they occur there shall be substituted

the words “aged 60 years or more”, and
(b) the definition of “pensionable age” in each place where it occurs shall be omitted.

(6)  In entry 1 in Schedule 3 for “£26.50” there shall be substituted “ £27.25”.
(7)  For entries 2 and 3 in Schedule 3 there shall be substituted the entries set out in Schedule 1

to these Regulations.
(8)  After Schedule 3 there shall be inserted the Schedule set out in Schedule 2 to these

Regulations.

(1) S.I.1997/290, amended by S.I. 1998/558, 1999/765.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1997/290
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1998/558
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1999/765


Document Generated: 2024-04-16
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

2nd March 2000
Chris Smith

Secretary of State for Culture, Media and Sport

We consent to these Regulations

6th March 2000

Bob Ainsworth
Greg Pope

Two of the Commissioners of Her Majesty’s
Treasury

2


