
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2002 No. 238

The Social Security (Contributions)
(Amendment) Regulations 2002

Amendments to the principal Regulations

3. In regulation 10 (earnings limits and thresholds)—
(a) for “2001” substitute “2002”;
(b) in paragraph (a) for the figure “£72” (lower earnings limit for primary Class 1

contributions) substitute the figure “£75”;
(c) in paragraph (b) for the figure “£575” (upper earnings limit for primary Class 1

contributions) substitute the figure “£585”;
(d) in paragraph (c) for the figure “£87” (primary threshold for primary Class 1 contributions)

substitute the figure “£89”; and
(e) in paragraph (d) for the figure “£87” (secondary threshold for secondary Class 1

contributions) substitute the figure “£89”.


