
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2002 No. 2641

The Motor Vehicles (Driving Licences)
(Amendment) Regulations 2002

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Motor Vehicles (Driving Licences) (Amendment)
Regulations 2002 and shall come into force on 14th November 2002.

Amendments to the Motor Vehicles (Driving Licences) Regulations 1999

2. The Motor Vehicles (Driving Licences) Regulations 1999(1) are amended in accordance with
regulations 3 to 8.

3. In regulation 3(1) in the definition of “theory test” for the words “theoretical test” there shall
be substituted “test of driving theory and hazard perception”.

4. In regulation 30(1)(b) for “£15.50” there shall be substituted “£18”.

5. In regulation 40—
(1)  In paragraph (2)(a) for the words “theoretical test” there shall be substituted the words “test

of driving theory and hazard perception”.
(2)  For paragraph (5)(a) there shall be substituted—

“(a)   the theory test if he satisfies the person conducting the test—
(i) in respect of the test of driving theory described in paragraph (8A) of this

knowledge and understanding of the specific matters; and
(ii) in respect of the hazard perception test described at paragraph (8B) that his

performance in the test demonstrates an ability to perceive hazards on the road;”
(3)  For paragraph (8) there shall be substituted—

“(8)  The theory test shall be conducted in two parts, one part being the test of driving
theory described in paragraph (8A) and the other being the hazard perception test described
in paragraph (8B).”

(4)  After paragraph (8) there shall be inserted the following—
“(8A)  The test of driving theory shall—

(a) be conducted as an approved form of examination consisting of 35 questions, the
questions being in either a multiple choice or multiple response form and testing
a candidate on the specified matters in accordance with Schedule 7; and

(b) have a duration of 40 minutes or, in the circumstances specified in paragraph (9),
80 minutes.

(8B)  The hazard perception test shall—

(1) S.I. 1999/2864. Schedule 5 was substituted by the Motor Vehicles (Driving Licences) (Amendment) (No. 4) Regulations 2001
(S.I. 2001/2779).

[DfT 12935]

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1999/2864
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/2779


Document Generated: 2024-07-13
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(a) be conducted by means of the exhibition of film clips that take the perspective of
the driver of a motor vehicle and show, at some point during each film clip, one
or more hazards to traffic occurring on or near the road; and

(b) require the candidate (using electronic equipment provided for the purpose and
capable of recording the exact moment of each response) to indicate during each
film clip the moment he observes a hazard relating to traffic on the road.

(8C)  For the purposes of this regulation—
“an approved form of examination” means a form of examination which is conducted
in writing or by means of data recorded on equipment operating in response to
instructions given by the candidate, and;
“film clip” means a sequence of visual images displayed electronically.”

6. In Regulation 47(8) for “£5” there shall be substituted “£7.50”.

7. In Regulation 48(3)(a) for “£2.43” there shall be substituted “£2.75”.

8. For the table in Schedule 5 (fees for practical and unitary tests) there shall be substituted the
table in the Schedule to these Regulations.

Signed by authority of the Secretary of State for Transport

20th October 2002

David Jamieson
Parliamentary Under Secretary of State,

Department for Transport

We approve the making of these Regulations.

21st October 2002

Philip Woolas
Jim Fitzpatrick

Two of the Lords Commissioners of Her
Majesty’s Treasury

2


