
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2002 No. 548

The National Health Service (Charges for Drugs
and Appliances) Amendment Regulations 2002

Amendment of regulation 5 of the principal Regulations

5.—(1)  Regulation 5 of the principal Regulations (supply of drugs and appliances by Health
Authorities, NHS trusts and Primary Care Trusts) shall be amended as follows.

(2)  In paragraph (1)(a) and (d) and paragraph (5) for “£6.10” on each occasion it appears there
shall be substituted “£6.20”.

(3)  In paragraph (1)(a) and (c) for “£12.20” on each occasion it appears there shall be substituted
“£12.40”.


