Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2002 No. 668

The Social Security Benefits Up-rating Order 2002

PART II
SOCIAL SECURITY BENEFITS AND PENSIONS

Increase in rates of Disability Living Allowance

12. In regulation 4 of the Social Security (Disability Living Allowance) Regulations 1991(1)
(rate of benefit)—

(a) in paragraph (1)(a) for “£55.30”, substitute “£56.25”;
(b) in paragraph (1)(b) for “£37.00”, substitute “£37.65”;
(c) in paragraph (1)(c) for “£14.65”, substitute “£14.90;
(d) in paragraph (2)(a) for “£38.65”, substitute “£39.30”; and
(e) in paragraph (2)(b) for “£14.65”, substitute “£14.90”.

(1) S.I. 1991/2890; relevant amending instruments are S.I. 1993/1939 and 2001/207.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1991/2890
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1993/1939
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/207

