Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

NN RN

2003 No. 1735
IMMIGRATION

The Asylum Support Appeals
(Procedure) (Amendment) Rules 2003

Made - - - - 10th July 2003
Laid before Parliament 15th July 2003
Coming into force 11th August 2003

THE ASYLUM SUPPORT APPEALS
(PROCEDURE) (AMENDMENT) RULES 2003

Citation and commencement

Amendments to the Asylum Support Appeals (Procedure) Rules 2000
In rule 3(3), for “2 days”, substitute “3 days”.

In rule 4(2), for “On the day after the day”,...

In rule 6(1), for “4 days”, substitute “not later than...

In rule 6(2), for “4 days”, substitute “5 days”.

In rule 13(1)(d), for “2 days”, substitute “3 days”.

For the notice of appeal form in the Schedule, substitute...

Signature

SCHEDULE — Asylum Support Adjudicators

Explanatory Note



