Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2003 No. 646 (L. 13)
SUPREME COURT OF ENGLAND AND WALES

The Supreme Court Fees (Amendment) Order 2003

Made - - - - 7th March 2003
Laid before Parliament 11th March 2003
Coming into force 1st April 2003

THE SUPREME COURT FEES (AMENDMENT) ORDER 2003

1. Citation, commencement and interpretation
2. In this Order a fee or column referred to by...
3. Amendments to the Supreme Court Fees Order 1999
4. For columns 1 and 2 of fee 1.1(b), substitute— Column...
5. Incolumn 2 of fee 1.2, for “£120”, substitute “£180”....
6. After fee 1.4, in column 1, insert— Fee 1.4 No...
7. In column 2 of fee 1.6(b), for “£120”, substitute “£180”....
8. In column 2 of fee 2.1, for “£80”, substitute “£120”....
9. Infee 2.2— (a) in column 1, for “7 days”,...
10. For columns 1 and 2 of fees 2.3(a) and (b)...
11.  In column 2 of fee 2.4, for “£50”, substitute “£60”....
12. Infee 2.5— (a) in column 1, before “Fees 2.4...
13. In column 2 of fee 2.7, for “£25”, substitute “£30”....
14. In column 2 of fee 3.1, for “£20”, substitute “£30”....
15. In column 2 of fee 3.4, for “£80”, substitute “£90....
16. In column 2 of fee 6.1(a), for “£120”, substitute “£140”....
17.  In column 2 of fee 6.1(b), for “£150”, substitute “£180™....
18. In column 2 of fee 6.2, for “£100”, substitute “£130”....
19. In column 2 of fee 6.3, for “£150”, substitute “£180”....
20. In column 2 of fee 6.4(a), for “£50”, substitute “£60”....
21. After fee 6.4, insert— Column 1 Column 2 Number and...
22. In column 2 of fee 10.2, for “£180”, substitute “£250....
23.  For columns 1 and 2 of fee 10.4, substitute— Column...
24. In column 2 of fee 10.5, for “£20”, substitute “£30”....
25.  After fee 10.5, insert— Column 1 Number and description of...

Signature
Explanatory Note



