
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2003 No. 650

LEGAL SERVICES
COMMISSION,ENGLAND AND WALES

The Community Legal Service (Financial)
(Amendment) Regulations 2003

Made       -      -      -      - 5th March 2003

Laid before Parliament 11th March 2003

Coming into force in accordance with regulation 1

THE COMMUNITY LEGAL SERVICE (FINANCIAL)
(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2003

1. Citation and commencement  
2. Interpretation  
3. Amendments to the Community Legal Service (Financial) Regulations

2000
 

4. In regulation 4(2), for “income-based jobseeker’s allowance”, substitute— ,
income-based...

 

5. (1) In regulation 5(2), for “£611” substitute “£621”;  
6. In regulation 5A(4), for “£2,250” substitute “£2,288”.  
7. In regulation 5B— (a) omit paragraph (1);  
8. In regulation 38(2)(a)— (a) for “£263” substitute “£267”;  
9. For regulation 38(8), substitute— (8) Paragraph (9) applies where the...  

10. In regulation 43— (a) in paragraph (1), for “(3) and...  
  Signature  
  Explanatory Note  


