
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Social Security (Students
and Income-related Benefits) Amendment Regulations 2004, Section 2. (See end of Document for details)

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2004 No. 1708

The Social Security (Students and Income-
related Benefits) Amendment Regulations 2004

Amendments in relation to the disregard of travel costs and the cost of books and equipment

2.—(1)  In sub-paragraph (a) of each of the provisions specified in paragraph (3) for “£270”
substitute “ £275 ”.

(2)  In sub-paragraph (b) of each of the provisions specified in paragraph (3) for “£335” substitute
“ £343 ”.

(3)  The provisions M1 specified for the purposes of paragraphs (1) and (2) (which relate
respectively to sums to be disregarded from the calculation of grant income and from student loans)
are—

F1(a) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .
F1(b) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .

(c) regulations 62(2A) and 66A(5) of the Income Support Regulations;
(d) regulations 131(3) and 136(5) of the Jobseeker’s Allowance Regulations.

Textual Amendments
F1 Reg. 2(3)(a)(b) revoked (6.3.2006) by The Housing Benefit and Council Tax Benefit (Consequential

Provisions) Regulations 2006 (S.I. 2006/217), reg. 1(1), Sch. 1 (with regs. 2, 3, Sch. 3, Sch. 4)

Marginal Citations
M1 The relevant amending instruments are S.I. 1990/1549, 1999/1935, 2000/1922, 2001/2319, 2002/1589,

2003/1701 and 1914.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/217
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/217
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/217/regulation/1/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/217/schedule/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/217/regulation/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/217/regulation/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/217/schedule/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/217/schedule/4
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1990/1549


Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Social Security (Students and
Income-related Benefits) Amendment Regulations 2004, Section 2.


