
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2004 No. 220

The Social Security (Contributions)
(Amendment No. 2) Regulations 2004

Amendments to the Social Security (Contributions) Regulations 2001

3. Amend regulation 10 (earnings limits and thresholds)(1) as follows—
(a) for “2003” substitute “2004”;
(b) in paragraph (a) for “£77” substitute “£79”;
(c) in paragraph (b) for “£595” substitute “£610”; and
(d) in paragraphs (c) and (d) for “£89” substitute “£91”.

(1) Regulation 10 was amended by regulation 3 of S.I.2002/238 and by regulation 5 of S.I. 2003/193.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2002/238
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2003/193

