
Document Generated: 2024-04-22
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCHEDULE

THE NURSING AND MIDWIFERY COUNCIL (FEES) (AMENDMENT) RULES 2005

Amendments to the principal Rules

3. In rule 3 of the principal Rules (fees)—
(a) for the words “or evaluation” substitute “, an evaluation or a retention”;
(b) in the table—

(i) omit row (a);
(ii) in the entry in column (2) of row (b), omit the words “other than one to which (a)

above applies,”;
(iii) in the entry in column (3) of row (b), for “£129” substitute “£43”;
(iv) in the entry in column (3) of row (c), for “£162” substitute “£76”;
(v) in the entry in column (3) of row (e), for “£129” substitute “£43”;

(vi) in the entry in column (3) of row (f), for “£129” substitute “£43”;
(vii) in the entry in column (2) of row (g), for the words “(a) to” substitute “(b),”; and

(viii) after row (h), add row (i)—

“(i) a retention of registration £43.”

1


