
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2005 No. 347

The Police Act 1997 (Criminal Records)
(Amendment) Regulations 2005

Fees for criminal record certificates and enhanced criminal record certificates

3.—(1)  In regulation 4 of the 2002 Regulations for “£28” there shall be substituted “£29”.
(2)  In regulation 4A of the 2002 Regulations for “£33” there shall be substituted “£34”.


