Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2005 No. 640

The National Care Standards Commission (Commission for
Social Care Inspection) (Fees and Frequency of Inspections)
(Adoption Agencies) (Amendment) Regulations 2005

Amendment of regulation 4 of the principal Regulations
3. Regulation 4 of the principal Regulations (variation fees) is amended as follows—
(a) in paragraph (1)(a), for “£550” substitute “£660”’;
(b) in paragraph (1)(b), for “£300” substitute “£360”;
(c) in paragraph (2)(a), for “£1,100 substitute “£1,320”;
(d) in paragraph (2)(b), for “£300” substitute “£360”’; and
(e) in paragraph (3), for “£50” substitute “£60”.



