
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2006 No. 2229

The Tonnage Tax (Training Requirement)
(Amendment) Regulations 2006

Payments in lieu of training

3.—(1)  The 2000 Regulations are amended as follows.
(2)  In regulation 15(1)(b) (payments in lieu of training), for “£621” substitute “£634”.
(3)  In regulation 21(4) (higher rate of payment in case of failure to meet training requirement),

for “£565” substitute “£577”.

[DfT 13923]


