
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2007 No. 118

The Social Security (Contributions)
(Amendment) Regulations 2007

Amendments to the Social Security (Contributions) Regulations 2001

4.  Amend regulation 11(3) (prescribed equivalents)(1) as follows—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£420” substitute “£435”; and
(b) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£5,035” substitute “£5,225”.

(1) Regulation 11(3) was amended by regulation 4 of S.I. 2006/127; there are other amending instruments but none is relevant.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/127

