
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2007 No. 2204

The Civil Procedure (Amendment) Rules 2007

Amendments to the Civil Procedure Rules 1998

14. In Part 46—
(a) in the parenthesis following rule 46.1(2)(c), for “patients” substitute “protected parties”;
(b) in rule 46.2(1), in the table—

(i) for “Up to £3,000” substitute “No more than £3,000”;
(ii) for “£350” substitute “£485”;

(iii) for “£500” substitute “£690”; and
(iv) for “£750” substitute “£1,035”;

(c) in rule 46.3(2), for “£250” substitute “£345”; and
(d) in rule 46.3(4), for “£350” substitute “£485”.


