
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2007 No. 604

The Blood Safety and Quality (Amendment) Regulations 2007

Amendment of regulation 22 of the principal Regulations

4.—(1)  Regulation 22 of the principal Regulations (fees) shall be amended as follows.
(2)  In paragraph (2)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£2,444” substitute “£2,688”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£400” substitute “£449”; and
(c) in sub-paragraph (c), for “£304” substitute “£387”.

(3)  In paragraph (2A), in sub-paragraph (b), for “£375” substitute “£432”.
(4)  In paragraph (3)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£8,729” substitute “£13,153”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£5,557” substitute “£8,402”;
(c) in sub-paragraph (c), for “£2,698” substitute “£4,120”;
(d) in sub-paragraph (d), for “£1,518” substitute “£2,353”;
(e) in sub-paragraph (e), for “£4,048” substitute “£6,143”; and
(f) in sub-paragraph (f), for “£7,590” substitute “£11,449”.

(5)  In paragraph (3A), for “£400” substitute “£600”.
(6)  In paragraph (3C), in sub-paragraph (c), for “£375” substitute “£432”.
(7)  In paragraph (5)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£759” substitute “£1,126”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£2024” substitute “£3,071”; and
(c) in sub-paragraph (c), for “£3795” substitute “£5,724”.

(8)  In paragraph (5B)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£2,000” substitute “£2,996”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£3,000” substitute “£4,494”; and
(c) in sub-paragraph (c), for “£4,000” substitute “£5,992”.

(9)  In paragraph (5C)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£500” substitute “£750”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£1,250” substitute “£1,875”; and
(c) in sub-paragraph (c), for “£2,000” substitute “£3,000”.


