Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2007 No. 768

The Value Added Tax (Amendment) (No.2) Regulations 2007

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Value Added Tax (Amendment) (No.2) Regulations
2007 and come into force on 1st April 2007.

2. The Value Added Tax Regulations 1995(1) are amended as follows.

Cash accounting
3. Inregulation 58(1)(a) (admission) for“£660,000” substitute “£1,350,000”.
4. In regulation 60(1) (exit) for “£825,000” substitute “£1,600,000”.
5. In regulation 61(2) (rules on withdrawal) for “£660,000” substitute “£1,350,000”.

Input tax and partial exemption
6. In regulation 99(1)(a) before “103” insert “102,”.

7. Inregulation 101—
(a) for sub-paragraphs (b)(i) to (v) of paragraph (3) substitute—
“(1) any supply of a description falling within Group 5 of Schedule 9 to the Act,
(i1) any other financial transaction, and
(ii1) any real estate transaction,”,
(b) after paragraph (5) insert—

“(6) For the purposes of this regulation, a “real estate transaction” includes any grant,
assignment (including any transfer, disposition or sale), surrender or reverse surrender of
any interest in, right over or licence to occupy land.”.

8. Inregulation 102—
(a) in paragraph (1) for “paragraph (2)” substitute “paragraphs (2) and (9)”,
(b) at the end of paragraph (1) omit all the words after “regulation 101 to the end,
(c) after paragraph (1) insert—
“(1A) A method approved or directed under paragraph (1) above—
(a) shall be in writing,

(b) may attribute input tax which would otherwise fall to be attributed under
regulation 103 provided that, where it attributes any such input tax, it shall
attribute it all, and

(c) shall identify the supplies in respect of which it attributes input tax by reference
to the relevant paragraph or paragraphs of section 26(2) of the Act.”,
(d) in paragraph (2) for “within regulation 101(3)” substitute “of a description falling within
regulation 101(3) whether made within or outside the United Kingdom”, and

(1) S.I. 1995/2518; relevant amending instruments are S.I. 1996/1250, 1997/1614, 1999/3114, 2000/794, 2002/1074, 2003/3220,
2004/767,2004/3140 and 2005/762.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1995/2518
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1996/1250
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1997/1614
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1999/3114
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2000/794
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2002/1074
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2003/3220
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2004/767
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2004/3140
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2005/762

Document Generated: 2024-04-09

Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(e) after paragraph (8) insert—

“(9) With effect from 1st April 2007 the Commissioners shall not approve the use of a
method under this regulation unless the taxable person has made a declaration to the effect
that to the best of his knowledge and belief the method fairly and reasonably represents
the extent to which goods or services are used by or are to be used by him in making
taxable supplies.

(10) The declaration referred to in paragraph (9) above shall—
(a) be in writing,

(b) be signed by the taxable person or by a person authorised to sign it on his behalf,
and

(c) include a statement that the person signing it has taken reasonable steps to ensure
that he is in possession of all relevant information.

(11) Where it appears to the Commissioners that a declaration made under this
regulation is incorrect in that—

(a) the method does not fairly and reasonably represent the extent to which goods
or services are used by or are to be used by the taxable person in making taxable
supplies, and

(b) the person who signed the declaration knew or ought reasonably to have known
this at the time when the declaration was made by the taxable person,

they may subject to paragraph (12) below serve on the taxable person a notice to that effect
setting out their reasons in support of that notification and stating the effect of the notice.

(12) The Commissioners shall not serve a notice under this regulation unless they are
satisfied that the overall result of the application of the method is an over-deduction of
input tax by the taxable person.

(13) Subject to paragraph (14) below, the effect of a notice served under this regulation
is that regulation 102B(1) shall apply to the person served with the notice in relation to—

(a) prescribed accounting periods commencing on or after the effective date of the
method, and

(b) longer periods to the extent of that part of the longer period falling on or after
the effective date of the method, save that no adjustment shall be required in
relation to any part of any prescribed accounting period,

unless or until the method is terminated under regulation 102(3).

(14) In relation to any past prescribed accounting periods, the Commissioners may
assess the amount of VAT due to the best of their judgement and notify it to the taxable
person unless they allow him to account for the difference in such manner and within such
time as they may require.

(15) The service of a notice on a taxable person under this regulation shall be without
prejudice to the Commissioners’ powers to serve a notice on him under regulation 102A
and any notice served under regulation 102A shall take priority in relation to the periods
which it covers.

(16) In this regulation “the effective date of the method” is the date when the method
to which the declaration relates first takes effect and may predate the date when the
declaration was made.

(17) In this regulation and in regulations 102A, 102B, 102C and 107, where
paragraph (1A)(b) above applies, “taxable supplies” includes supplies of a description
falling within regulation 103.”.



Document Generated: 2024-04-09
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

9. At the beginning of regulation 102A(1) insert “Notwithstanding the Commissioners’ powers
to serve a notice under regulation 102,”.

10. At the beginning of regulation 103 insert “Other than where it falls to be attributed under a
method approved or directed by the Commissioners under regulation 102,”.

11. As a heading to regulation 103 A insert “Attribution of input tax to investment gold”.

New means of transport

12. In Schedule 1, for the form numbered 13 (new means of transport for removal from the UK to
another member state of the European Community) substitute the form numbered 13 in the Schedule
to these Regulations.

Paul Gray

Mike Eland

Two of the Commissioners for Her Majesty’s

8th March 2007 Revenue and Customs



